
V-W%3 ! 

f TJjPt % " r ^ V*' VX> f 5 

THE ONLY EIGHT-PAGE ONE-CENT DAILY IN THE SVORWALKS. 

- - v - A 

• : ; ^ : 3  '  

Yol. VI. Whole No. 1469 
Sorwalk, Conn., Saturday Evening, October 17, 1896. Price One Cent 

A OREAT MEETING. 
Voters Turn Out For Sound 

Moiie^. * 

The Opera House Packed. 

Unquestionably the greatest cam­
paign meeting held in Norwalk since 
war days, was that of last night at the 
Opera House* Hundreds were turned 

„away unable to force an entrance even 
to the head of the stairs. Attorney, and 
to be, Representative .Hurlbutt presi­
ded. E. O. Keeler was the first speak­
er and his address was a sound, busi­
ness man's argument for protection and 
honest money and enthusiastically ap­
preciated by the packed audience. 
Keeler was followed by Congressman 
Hill who made cAe of the clearest, most 
exhaustive and effective arguments on 
the burning issues of the campaign, 
heard from any platform in this con­
test. Indeed our eminently capable 
^nd earnest Congressman, fairly outdid 
himself and the vast crowd gave him 
the closest attention throughout and 
seemingly would have been glad to 
have had him talk till morning. 

The railroad accident which delayed 
Senator Piatt and the Bridgeport Glee 
club, until after ten o'clock, was most 
advantageously used in clearly, fully 
and successfully elucidating the free 
coinage of silver heresy. 

The songs of the Tippecannoe club 
were simply immense and carried the 
vast audience to the highest pitch of 
delight and enthusiasm. 

It was nearly midnight before the 
audience seemed willing to disperse. 

As the Glee club could not return to 
Bridgeport before 1 o'clock a. m. a 
pretty and appropriate little banquet 
was spread by Landlord Tuttle for 
them, and tli9 intervening time was 
delightfully consumed in refreshing the 
inner man, singing and Bpeech making. 
Attorney Hurlbutt ected as toastmaster 
and called out Senator Piatt, Congress­
man Hill, E. O. Keeler, Judge Wood­
ward, Colonel Frost,Senator Marigold, 
"Brad" Keith and others. A special 
street railway car conveyed the jovial 
singers to their train, and Senator Piatt 
accompanied his host, Mr, Hill, and re­
mained his guest until this morning, 
when the Senator left for New York. 

All in all, it was a memorable occa­

sion. 

A GOOD MOVE. 

The Honnecker Building to be Succeeded 
by a Modern Structure. 

• It was stated to a GAZETTE reporter 
this morning that Aurelius J. Meeker 
had purchased the of late very much in 
dispute as to value, Honnecker build­
ing on Wall street at the foot of Mill 
Hill and ^at ho intends moving the 
s&me to a site on his Brook street 
property near by, and will fit the same 
up as a tenement house. 

The more cheering news though is 
that Miss Honnecker will erect on the 

-site of the old building a structure of 
modern architecture'iml <>ne that will 
be in accord with uthor improve­
ments made in and about East Wall 
street. 

The contract has not yet been award­
ed but the building will be pushed for. 
ward to as early a completion as pos­
sible. 

Congressman Hill's " Sample Case." 
"Who is that drummer with the sam­

ple case of window shades and curtain 
fixtures?" asked a passenger in a Con­
solidated train the other day. "I've 
seen him every time I've been on a 
train for the last two monthp, and he's 
as full of politics as an egg is of 
chicken." "Why, that isn't a curtain 
drummer," was the reply, that's Con­
gressman Hil), and that 'sample case' 
contains the charts with which he illus­
trates his speeches on the money ques­
tion."—Daily News. 

That "sample case" has proved one 
; of the most convincing object lesson?, 

that this campaign has produced. 

NorWalk's Representatives. 

- What an ideal ticket for Representa­
tives from Norwalk, the names of J. 
BELDEN HURLBUTT and RUSSELL FROST, 
would constitute. 

In legal ability, high personal and 
attractive character, no town in the 
state would excel Norwalk, with these 
two men in the House. 

Will Shut Down. 

I The Connecticut Steam Laundry on 
Haviland street, South Norwalk, closes 
up business to-day, and the plant is 
offered for sale. An interesting adv. 
in reference to the matter will be found 
in another column. 

SJAND8CONVIOTED. 
Thomas WIcMullen Guilty of 

Evading the License Law. 

Escapes with a Fins of $15 and Costs. 

The adjourned case cf the State vs. 
Thomas McMulleD, who was placed 
under arrest on election day for not 
complying witb the license law, was 
continued at police headquarters yes­
terday afternoon, Judge Hubbell pre­
siding. 

The defendant presented a number 
of witnesses in his behalf but on the 
whole their tastimanv w id m >re damag­
ing than helpful seemed to 
many to be at the best u vary weak de­

fense. 
Attorney Lonkwood appeared for the 

prosecution and Attorney Hurlbutt for 
the defense. 

The Judge found the accused guilty 
and fined him <515 andcostp, from which 
decision McMullen look an appeal and 
furnished bonds in the sum of $150 for 
his appearance before tha Court of 
Common Pleas for trial. 

In the meantime McMullin's chances 
of procuring a license are far from be­
ing favorable. 

McMullin's saloon is located on Frank­
lin avenue and has been a source of 
much concern to the law-abiding resi­
dents of that neighborhood. 

JUMPED THE TRACK. 

Traffic Between Bridgeport and New York 

Greatly Delayed. 

Freight train No. 309 south bound, of 
the Naugatuck division of the Consol­
idated road, left the track at the en­
trance to the yards in Bridgeport at 5.45 
yesterday The engine and three cars 
took a course directly across the main 
line tracks, so that New York traffic 
either way was blocked. Neither En­
gineer O'Hara nor his fireman nor any 
of the train crew was injured. The 
train was in charge of Conductor Mac-
Farland. 

At 7 o'clock, a wrecking train arrived 
from New Haven, and after an hour 
and three-quarters of hard work, the 
derailed engine was pulled back upon 
the tracks. The east bound track was 
cleared first. 

Among the trains delayed were: East 
bound, the 6:03 accomodation, the G.20 
Shore Line express, the 7.30 accommo­
dation, and the 7:30 express. West­
bound, the 5:56 express, the 6:15 and 
7:40 accommodation trains and the 7:36 
express. Besides these, there were a 
dozen or more freights sandwiched in 
betweeri, and trains were held in the 
blocks as far east and west as the 
Naugatnck Junction and Southport. 
The blockade naturally affected the 
whole road, and the time schedule was 
not straightened out all night. 

On one of the delayed trains were 
Senator O.H. Piatt and the Tippecanoe 
club who had been announced to ap­
pear at the Republican rally in the 

Opera House last night. 

Funeral of Jesse H. Canfield. 
The funeral of Jesse H. Canfield a 

conductor on the Consolidated railroad, 
and who died at his home in New 
Haven, yesterday, will be attended 
from 166 Davenport avenue, New 
Haven, to-night at 8 o'clock. The 
burial will take place at 9:30 to-mor­
row morning at Riverside cemetery, 
this city. The deceased was a member 
of St. John's Lodge, F. & a. m. of 
Hartford, and was also an Odd Fellow. 
Rev. A. H. Wyatt will officiate at the 
burial service. The mother of the de­
ceased is Mrs. Anthony Canfield of 
Merwin street, he has a sister living in 
Brooklyn. Builder J. R. Raymond of 
South Norwalk is his nepbew. 

Within the Proscribed 200 feet. 
As the saloon at present occupied by 

Daniel Hanlon is within 200 feet of the 
Public Library, it is not believed that 
the county commissioners will reissue a 
licensp for the place. To avoid any 
complications for a license at his pres­
ent saloon it is understood that Mr. 
Hanlon will lease one of the stores in 
the proposed new building to be erect­
ed by the Hanlon Brothers adjoining 
the Quintard building. 

A Monster Petition. 

Within a few weeks, a monster peti­
tion, praying that school books be 
furnished free of cost to all of the pu­
pils of the Bridgeport public schools 
will be submitted to the Board of Edu­
cation. The petition has been in 
circulation for a week, and now has 
in the neighborhood of 20,003 signa­
tures. 

Advertise in the GAZETTE, 

SUBSTANTIAL TOKEN 
Rev. ). J. Furlong Presented 

with a Purse of $800. 

He Won the Friendship of All. 

The Rockville correspondent of the 
the Hartford Courant furnishes the 
following, which will be of interest to 
Norwalk people: 

St. Bernard's Roman Catholic church 
was crowded Thursday evening by 
friends of the Rev. J. J.Furlong to pay 
their respects to him. They took with 
them a substantial token of regard. 
Father Murray, the present assistant at 
St. Bernand's, w,as spokesman for tae 
parishioners assembled, and in behalf 

.of them presented to Father Furlong, 
who has since left for Norwalk, a purse 
containing nearly $800. 

Father Furlong responded very feel­
ingly and regretted bis departure. He 
would always remember his long life 
among the people of Rockville with 
pleasure. After his remarks the people 
took the opportunity to shake hands 
with him, and one pleasant incident 
was the fact that nearly every one who 
took leave of the reverend gentleman 
was called by name. During his 25 
year's stay he has won the friendship of 
all the citizens of the city, who will 
miss him for a long while to come. 

The reverend gentleman is in Nor­
walk to day and has assumed charge of 
St. Mary's parish. He will to-morrow 
appear in his offizial capacity at the 
services in the church and is already 
assured of a heaity welcome. 

Rev. Father Barry, curate, who has 
already made many friends in town it 
is understood will remain as Father 
Furlong's assistant. With two such 
men who are bound to he well liked by 
all,the parish will no doubt continue to 
uphold its reputation as being one of 
the best in this Catholic diocese. 

OYSTER GROUND TAX. 

The Total Income Over $100,000 and 
Nearly All From Taxes. 

From figures obtained at the office of 
the state shell fish commissioners it is 
shown that the year ended Oct. 1 was 
the most successful since the commis" 
sion was established and the net income 
to the state will be increased over that 
of last year more than 100 per cent. 
And this is to be done in the face of 
many additional expenses, including 
one-third of the money obtained from 
•taxes which mu3t, be expended in main­
tenance of oyster police. 

The total gross income amounts to a 
little more than $103,000, of which 
$8,786 45 was received as taxes. About 
$1,000 was received from licenses for 
boats to dredge on the natural beds 
and something les3 than $1,000 more 
was received from the sale of oyster 

.grounds. 
The amount of tax mnoey to be divi­

ded among the six state oyster police­
men is $2,928.81. This will not cover 
the entire amount of the police salary 
list, and the balance of about $3,500 
will be made up by the r.yster growers 
of the state. 

Clerk Matthewman is at work now 
figuring out the amount due the several 
districts and as soon as he has finished 
the money will be paid over to the men. 
The oyster growers will then hold a 
meeting, which will be called within 
a week or two, and the balance made 
up by private subscription. The oys­
ter policemen are paid $3 a day for 
every day in the year. 

The net income to the state from the 
shell fish commission last year was 
$1,016. According to the estimate of 
Clerk Matthewman the net income this 
year will be considerably more than 
$2,000. 

. 

The W. C. T. U. Convention. 

The convention of the Women's 
Christian Temperance Union closed at 
Meriden yesterday. Officers were elec­
ted as follows: President, Mrs. S. B. 
Forbes, Hartford; corresponding sec­
retary, Mrs. Mary B. Andrews, Stam­
ford; recording secretary, MrB. S. K. 
Luce, Niantic; treasurer, Mrs. A. M. 
Herr, Norwich; honorary secretaries, 
Mrs. C. B. Buell, East Hampton; Mrs. 
Hannah C. Partridge, Jewett City, 
Mrs. IdaM. T. Pegrum, of Watertown, 
was elected secretary of the Young 
Woman's branch. 

Selleck's History No. II. # 

The second number of Selleck's His­
tory of Norwalk will be issued and for 
sale, about the middle of next week. 
It will be an exceedingly interesting 
and valuable number. Ancient Ave­
nues, Architecture, Home Lots, Coast 
Divisions, history of the Old Mill, etc. 

AETER TIORUNKS. 
A New Canaan Grand Juror 

Promises to Prosecute. 

He Gives Public Notice of the Fact. 

Arthur L. Benedict a New Canaan 
grand juror has published the following 
manifesto: 

"To all persons who use Intoxicating 
Beverages. Owing to the fact that 
the appearance of intoxicated persons 
upon the streets has become un'usually 
common, ftnd that such persons have of 
late made themselves unusually obnox­
ious to Iaw-abidirfg citizens of this 
Borough and Town. I hereby give 
public notice, that on and after Mon­
day, Oct. 19, 185/6, I shall bring com­
plaint in a justice court against each 
and every person who is found intoxi­
cated. And I hereby ask the co-opera­
tion of all good citizens to aid me in 
securing evidence which shall convict 
any person found intoxicated within the 
imits of the town of New Canaan. And 
I hereby give fuither fair notice and 
warning to all persons who are addicted 
to the intemperate use of intoxicating 
beverages that I shall arrest (without 
respect to person) all persons who are 
found intoxicated, and prosecute them 
under the Statute made and provided 
in such cases," 

A MISSING LANDLORD. 

The Proprietor of a Hotel in Danbury Sud­

denly Leaves Town. 

Martin J. Williamp, proprietor of the 
New England hotel, in Danbury, left 
town Monday morning ostensibly, to 
go to New York on business, and has 
not been seen since. 

He left the business of the hotel in 
bad sha^e, the stock of the bar room is 
almost entirely exhausted, and the 
employees of the hotel are left with un­
paid wages for several weeks back. It 
is thought that he took with him about 
$800 ia cash, , considerable of it being 
the earnings of the hotel during Fair 
week, when the place did a very large 
business. — > 

« Yesterday's Divorces. 

Judge Prentice in the Superior Court 
yesterday, considered several applica­
tions from mismated couples. A pecu-
lar case was the decree asked for by 
George D. Seeley of Easton, against 
Mary E. Seeley. They were married 
in 1871, and parted in 1881. Seeley 
subsequently understood that the wo­
man had secured a divorse from him, 
and a few months ago, when he dis­
covered this to be untrue, he icsituated 
proceedings on his own account, alleg­
ing adultery. Judge Prentice reserved 
his decision. 

Other cases were; Isabelle B. Burritt. 
of Stamford, against George W. Bur­
ritt. Ground, intemperance. Not 
granted. 

Mary Walsh agsinst Patrick Walsh. 
Ground intemperance. Granted. 

Matilda A. Weiss, against Simon 
Weis?. Charge, cruelty. Granted. 

New Driving Club. 
A number of gentlemen interested in 

driving horses held a meeting recently 
and organized a club for the promotion 
of interest in driving horses, under the 
name of the Bridgeport Driving club. 
The intention of the members of the 
club is to increase interest in the mati­
nee races which are now being held 
weekly at Seaside park, Bridgeport, 
also to designate the place and arrange 
the course for winter racing. And it is 
further the intention of the club to ar­
range carnival sleigh racing when the 
owners and drivers of fast horses of 
New Haven, Derby, Norwalk, Danbury 
and all of the surrounding towns will 
be invited to attend and participate. A 
meeting will be held next Tuesday 
evening, when the organization will be 
perfected and officers elected for the 
ensuing year. 

Insurance Reports. 
The report of Insurance Commission­

er Betts of his examination of fire and 
marine insurance companies, says the 
examination has benefitted both the 
companies and the department. In 
many cases the abstract of titles was 
not complete and valuations of proper­
ties bad not been'made for a number of 
years. The total number of companies 
is twenty.six, of which nine are joint 
stock and seventeen are mutual. 

- Company K's Kirmiss. 
Company K will open their Kirmiss 

at the Armory in Bridgeport to-night. 
Wednesday night will be military night 
and delegations are expected from Nor­
walk, Nek Haven, Stamford and Dan­
bury. 4^ •. . (,'V-V '=,v; 

STOLEAHORSE. 
The Thieves Discovered by the 

Owner of the Animal. 

The Property Recovered Soon After. 

Between 3 and 4 o'clock this morning 
Charles Sherwood who lives o.n Cedar 
street was awakened by the barking of 
a dog belonging to a neighbor. He got 

rout of bed and looking out of the win­
dow saw two men leading his horse put 
of the yard into the street. 

Raising the window he shouted after 
them as they proceeded up the street 
with the animal, "You better leave that 
horse alone.'' As they seemed tp pay 
no attention to him he shouted louder 
in order to alarm the neighbors. 

The thieves then left the horse and 
scooted out of sight. An immediate 
search for the animal was without avail, 
but it was some two hours after found 
on Stevens street. 

Mr. Sherwood says that the horse 
was, as he supposed, sifely stabled 
the night before. It was in evidence 
this morning that they had forced the 
hasp on the stable door and led the 
horse from the barn through the gar­
den to the ttreet, and would have suc­
ceeded in stealing it but for Mr. Sher­
wood's timely awakening by the dog. 

As it was dark he is unable to give 
any description of the thieves. 

Judge Hubbell Nominated. 
The Democratic Probate convention 

for the District of Norwalk was held at 
the Norwalk Hotel this morning. The 
delegates from Wilton and New Canaan 
failed to put in an appearance. The 
convention was called to order by John 
H. Ma'one. The delegates present 
were Messrs. Summerfield Tooker, 
William II. IIviand and Lao Davis as 
proxy for W. I Stevens. 

Mr. 11J land was elected chairman 
and Mr. Dav's secretary. The name 
of Jud^e J«nv>* f. Hubbell was placed 
in nomination for the office of Judge of 
Probate by a unamnions vote. 

Messis. R. E. Goldschmidt and John 
Murphy were reappointed on the coni-
mittee and the convention adjourned. 

Teachers Elect Officers. 
At a meeting of the Connecticut 

Teachers' association, in New Haven, 
yesterday, these officers were elected: 
President, W. B. Ferguson, Middle-
town; corresponding secretary, S. P. 
Williams, Colchester; recording secre­
tary, Miss Rachael Webster, New 
Haven; treasurer, G. B. Hurd, New 
Haven; vice-presidents, M. W. Griffin, 
Middlesex county; Mrs. R. M.Lathrop, 
Fairfield; C. F. Buell, New London; 
F. E. Burnett, Windham; J.H.Caffrey, 
New Haven; J. A. Stewart, Hartrord; 
E. H. Forbes, Litchfield; Samuel A. 
Jacobs, Tolland. 

Baptist State Convention. 
Beginning on Monday next and last­

ing three days, the Connecticut Bap­
tist State convention will hold its an­
nual sessions with the First Church of 
New London. The delegates from the 
First Baptist church of this city are 
Rev. F. E. Robbins and wife, Mr. Ed­
gar Buttery and wife, and Miss Ida 
Crowther. - Mr. Robbins and Miss 
Crowther willrepresent the local Union 
at the Baptist Young Peoples' Grand 
Rally at New London on Monday eve­
ning and Tuesday morning. 

Ye Olden Times. 
The interesting stories of the meeting 

in Norwalk between Gen. LaFayette 
and Major Samuel Comstock of Wilton, 
and of the spicy conversation, at the 
present Cashier Green's homesite, on 
the Winnipauk road, between John 
Hanford and one of Napoleon's sold­
iers, have been told this week in Nor­
walk by a citizen of Cleveland O^i", 
and by a son of a member of the old 
business house of Grinnell, Minturn 
& Co. of New York city. 

Lots of Remonstrance. 
It now looks as though there would 

be no small amount of remonstrance to 
the granting of licenses to certain 
parties who have it is alleged, evaded 
the liquor license laws. 

To Succeed Themselves. 
Senator O. H. Piatt, Congressman E. 

J. Hill and Judge Asa B. Woodward 
will succeed themselves, McKinley, 
protection and honest money, will as 
surely triumph. 

Dear Apples. 

A young man named Thomas Mc-
Mahon stole a peck of apples from a 
Stamford orchard, yesterday, and was 
arrested and fined $2. 

—Advertise in the GAZETTE 

DON'T MISS THEM. 
The Latest Ads. Received Be­

fore Going to Press. 

By the People and For the People. 

.FOR SAf'E. 

FOR SAI.E—a second-hand Columbia bi­
cycle, Price, 115. Can be seen at thia 

office. 

TjlQR SALE—Bicycles, guaranteed $75 189E 
JD -odel?, seamless steel tubinp, drot? 
for,ed steel connections, choice of tires. 139.W 
at SOUTH NOBWALK HABDWABE CO. j25 tf 

OR SAI/E—Benedict. Norwalk, newsdeal-
er, is selling an excellent Fountain Pen 

and Holder for 25c. Call and see it. jl2tf 
F 

TO RJEXT. 

TO RENT—The large and desirab'e store 
and basement No. 19 Main street; former­

ly occupied by W A. Benedict & Co. For 
terms apply to BALPH MOODY, 100 East avenue. 

014 lw 

Registrars' Notice. 
Notice is hejeby given tb«»t the Regis­

trars of Voters of the First Voting 
District of the Town of Aiorwaik, will 
be in session at the T<>wn Clerk's office 
in said District on W» dueeday, October 
21 s^, 1896, from 9 o'clock a. m. UDtil 5 
o'clock p. no; and on Saturday, October 
24th from 10 o'clock a m. until 5 o'clock, 
p. m., for the purpose of correcting 
and revising the voting list of said First 
Voting District. 

S-AMTJEL LYNES, >_ 
JOHN J, WALSH, j" 

Registrars of Voters of 
Firtt Voting District. 

Dated at Norwalk, October, 16, 1896. 

NORWALK OPERA HOUSE. 
F.W. MITCHELL, MANAGER. 

ONE WEEK, Commencing 

MONDAY Oct. 19 

Rice's Comedians, 
Special engsgementof the World's T argest 

Grandest and Be3t Amnsement En­
terprise now before the 

Public at 

Peoples' Popular Prices 
BEPEBTOIBE: 

Monday—"In the Trenches." 
Tuesday—"Beacon LiehW 
Wednesday—"All in the Family." 
Thursday—"Under the Lion's Paw." 
Friday—"'Twist Love and Duty." 
Saturday—"Dan'l Boone." 

23-People-25 
One Car Load Scenery; Elegant Costumes. 

Prices Only 10,20 and 30c. 
Seats on sale Friday at Weed's and Tomlin-

son's Drug Stores, 

CHEAP FUEL, 
Owing to many of the factories being 

shut down, -we have a large accumulation 
of first class coke. 

We offer the same during the month 
of October at six cents per bnshel at the 
works, or eight cents per bushel delivered 
within either city limits, in not less than 
twenty-five bushel lots. Extra for car­
rying in. . .. 

NORWALK 
GAS LIGHT COMPANY. 

C0NNECTI0UT - LAUNDRY, 
Haviland Stmt. 

For reasons unnecessary to state, we 
have concluded to shut down our steam 
plant on Saturday, October 17th. 

Our business has reached one hun­
dred iti.d twenty-five dollars a week, 
which it 1'cates that there is an excel-
)• 'it. fie]') here for a first-class hand 
laundry to succeed us. 

To any party acceptable as tenant to 
the owners of the buildiDg, we will turn 
over free of charge sufficient property, 
with slight alterations, to fully equip a 
fine hand laundry. 

The rental is $25 per month, and 
every convenience is in the building, 
which is a substantial brick edifice, re­
markably well lighted. We do not owe 
a dollar anywhere, so far as we know, 
but should we have overlooked any 
small item, it will be cashed upon pre­
sentation. 

Some accounts are due us which we 
shall be glad to receive direct or 
through either of our drivers. 

We very heartily thank all those who 
have so kindly given us their patronage. 

, •< 
• Jjti 

I • "'$11 

CONNECTICUT - LAUNDRY' 
Haviland Street. 

SoutliXorwalk, Conn' 
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.SWEET BYE AND BYE. 
ITS ORIGIN AND FIRST PUBLICATION 

BY MEN WHO SCORNED IT. 

LIFE ON THE EAST SIDE. 7 

A Physician Wrote the Verses, and a De­

spondent Musiciun Worked Out the 

Tune, All Withi#i Forty Minutes. The 

Piece Accepted Out of Pity. 

A. P. Webster, tlie composer of the 
music, was by 110 means unknown to 
the public at the time the song was 
published. He had won great pop­
ularity wih his "Lorena," "Paul 
Vane," "Little Maud." These had 
been published at Chicago by H. M. 
Higgins, who, with the writer, then 
a boy of twelve years, created a sale 
for them by singing them for ac­
quaintances and customers who came 
to purchase music. At that .time, in 
the early sixties, Webster lived at the 
little town of Elkhorn, Wis., and 
about twice a year he would come to 
Chicago with a roll of manuscript 
songs. These were usually written 
with a pencil, and in a hasty, scrawl­
ing manner, though the notes were al­
ways legible. The songs he offered 
for sale at $25 each, and the publisher 
would select what he thought would 
sell, and either pay him or agree to 
pay royalty. 

In 1866 or 1867, a young physician, 
Samuel Filmore Bennett, then lately 
graduated from Ann Arbor Univer­
sity, had become an intimate friend of 
Webster. They were, in fact, almost 
inseparable. One day Webster came 
into his office in a most despondent 
frame of mind. 

"What is the trouble now?" his 
friend asked. 

"It is no matter," Webster an­
swered with a sigh. "It will be all 
right by-and-bye." 

Like an inspiration the idea flashed 
upon Bennett, who had written sev­
eral war poems, to write some verses, 
and he said: 

"Why not make a song of the sweet 
by and bye?" Webster answered: 

"You write the verses and I'll make j 
the music." 

Turning to his desk Bennett hastily 
scribbled line after line,, and in less 
than half an hour the verses were 
completed. He handed them to Web­
ster, who raised his violin just as two 
friends entered. Not waiting to greet 
them he drew his bow, and without 
any hesitation played the tune which 
since has been sung by millions. He 
hastily jotted it down on waste pa­
per, and in less than ten minutes 
from the time he began the composi­
tion the four men were singing "The 
Sweet Bye and Bye." Thus origina­
ted the words and music of a hymn 
which has given consolation and hope 
to the- whole Christian world. The 
characters in the drama are few and 
humble, the surroundings most sim­
ple—the poor despondent musician, the 
young physician, two friends and a 
common office in a Western town. 

The composer, with his manuscript 
songs under his arm, appeared in Chi­
cago soon afterward. He hoped and 
expected to sell the manuscripts for 
$25 each; this meant $150 or $200 to 
take home. He went to the music 
store of Root & Cady, who had made 
a fortune with "The Battle Cry of 
Freedom" and other Avar songs. They 
examined his manuscripts, and took 
all except "The Sweet Bye and Bye." 
That they "did not think it worth 
publishing." 

Poor Webster! The sons he had 
counted on most was rejected! He 
could not go to Higgins again, for 
Higgins had hurt his feelings ,and re­
fused to publish any more of his 
songs. He finally thought of a new 
firm of young men from Boston, Lyon 
& Healey. They had treated him 
courteously, though they had pub­
lished nothing of his. Mr. Healy, af­
ter listening to the song on the piano, 
concluded to offer him $20 for it. This 
Webster accepted and seemed thank­
ful for. Little interest was shown 
toward the song. It was gotten out 
in cheapest form, and for a year had 
no sale. Finally a compiler obtained 
permission to bring it out in a book, 
and success soon followed. Silas G. 
Pratt, the critic, says: "Mr. Healy's 
and my own utter falure to see any­
thing in it is only another instance 
of how human judgment errs, and 
this was, in my own case, most keen­
ly emphasized, when, after having 
passed four years abroad studying, I 
returned to be greeted in New York 
on the ferry boats, steamboats and 
railway trains with the strains of 
'The Sweet Bye and Bye.' " 

Considerable Patience. 

Amusing if apocryphal stories are 
told of the extreme care for the feel­
ings of their physicians displayed by 
some patients. -One such tender heart­
ed man, seeing • his physician coming 
along the street, slipped , into a door­
way to avoid him. 

"Why did you do that?" inquired his 
companion. 

"Well," said the man, whose health 
had been poor until Avithin a year, 
'it's so long noAV since I'Are been sick, 
that I'm really ashamed to see him." 

An instance of still greater delicacy 
is recorded of a man whose case had 
been pronounced hopeless by his phy­
sician, but Avho afterward regained 
perfect health. He met the doctor on 
the street some time after his recov­
ery, and the latter had difficulty in 
making his former patient stop to 
speak with liiin. 

"What's the matter?" inquired the 
physician, bluntly. 

Why," returned the other, "you said 
I Avas dying, and I'm ashamed, to 
have you see me alive anil well!" 

Such tenderness as this merits the 
approval Avith which a quack is said 
to have commended a conscientious 
swallower of his medicines. 

•*^h, my dear sir," he said, with 
strong emotion, "you deserve to be 
ill!" -

Mr. Hudmaii and Mrs, Powers, in-Trying 
to Pass, Get Wedged on the Stairs. 

The New York Sun avers that had 
the architect planned the stairway a 
little bit wider it never would have 
happened, and the community dwelling 
in the tenement at 52 Jefferson street 
Avould not be torn by internicine dis­
sensions. But how was he to foresee 
that in the lapse of years two persons 
as i'at as Mr. Sholem Rudman and 
Mrs. Maggie. Powers would dispute 
over a question of precedence and try 
to settle it by an appeal to weight? 
That stairway had ansAvered all prac­
tical purposes for a long time. It 
had even sufficed for the passage of 
a parlor melodeon to the second floor, 
front, two years ago, when a swell 
family moved there Avith such furni­
ture as the place had neArer known be­
fore. A month later it moved out, 
leaving an aching void in the rent 
roll, as is fully set forth in the un­
written folk-lore of the neighborhood. 
However, that is neither here nor 
there, as Sholem Rudman didn't be­
long to that family; nor did Mrs. Mag­
gie Powers. 

They are both tenants- of the house 
now. In the pursuit of their house­
hold duties both set foot upon the 
stairs on Friday afternoon. Mrs. 
Maggie Powers was carrying back a 
groAvler of beer to the corner saloon 
with the intention of demanding ex­
planations from the bartender because 
there was more collar to the beer than 
there was neck to the pitcher. She 
also purposed to demand more beer. 
As she reached the head of the stairs 
leading to the ground floor she beheld 
Sholem Rudman at the foot. He had 
a basket of coal on his head. Now, 
either Sholem Rudman or Mrs. Mag­
gie Powers is a very tight fit for any 
non-elastic staircase. Together they 
could just about block a theatre en­
trance. Foreseeing difficulty, the wo­
man hailed first: 

"Hey, there! I'm comin' down." 
"And I'm goin' up,"' replied Rud­

man. 
"Wait till I get to the floor," said 

she. ® 
"Hold yourself up till I get to the 

top," he returned. 
"I have a load with me." 
"So have I." 
"My load is bigger than yours." 
"What is it?" 
"Beer." 
"Go and sleep it off." 
"Yer no gintleman." 
"You're no lady." 
"I'll show yez; I'm comin' down." 
"And I'm going up." 
Each advanced three steps, entirely 

shutting out the light; then each said 
triumphantly: 

"NOAV will you go back?" and an­
swered emphatically: 

"No." 
"I have the right more than you, 

you spalpeen," declared Mrs. Maggie 
Powers. 

"How, then?" 
"I'm a lady." 

' "You're Irish." 
"That's no argyment. You're Yed-

dish." 
"I got no time to talk with you. Go 

back and let me by." 
"Not while I have breath in me 

body." 
Each advanced three more steps 

and met. There was a straining and 
pushing and groaning. It ended as 
might have been foreseen. Both got 
Avedged fast. The beer bedewed them 
and the coal fell from Rudman's head 
upon them, and they jabbed each 
other with mad, fierce, short-arm jabs 
until their powers failed. Then both 
yelled for help. It came from above 
and below. The other tenants all took 
sides and quarreled fiercely over the 
rights and wrongs of the matter, 
AVhile the sufferers gasped broken and 
piteous appeals for relief Finally a 
charge from above broke the dead­
lock, and Mrs. Maggie Powers went 
to Essex Market and got a Avarrant 
for Rudman on a charge of assault. 
Being the man in the case he was 
fined ?5. 

A Suitable Description. 

"Come, old man, tell me what your 
fiance is like." 

"Well, she is a high grade girl with 
a '96 expression; weighs 112 pounds 
and has the narrowest tread I ever 
saw. Her AToice has a tone that is its 
own, and her heart is built like a 
watch, her disposition is perfectly ad­
justable and her temper comes with a 
brake, and she isn't the sort to be 
frightened because life isn't all as­
phalt."—Life. , 

The Wretch is Known. 

"We .take occasion to say," wrote 
the editor of the Skedunk Enterprise, 
"that the despicable wretch who stole 
our wife's bloomers off the clothes­
line in our backyard the other oight 
is known, and if he or she does not 
immediately return the same he or 
she will get into trouble. A word to 
the Avise is sufficient." 

Electric Capital. 

It is claimed that there is mor<j capi­
tal invested in the clue trie industry 
of the United States than in-all the 
rest of the Avorld. In round numbers, 
there is not less than $1,750,000 in­
vested in the industry in this country, 
not including capital in ocean cables. 

Verifying an Epitaph. 

Tenderfoot—I can't understand the 
epitaph on this tombstone: It says: 
"He talked himself to death." HOAV'S 

that? 
Bronco Pete—That's right. He 

called Alkali Ike a liar.—Chicago 
Tribune. 

Her Saving Consciousness. 

"I think it's a shame, Cyrus, that 
we've let Esmeralda grow up without 
trying to give her some kind of musi­
cal training. "She can't sing at all." 

"That's true, Emily—but she. knows 
it. m-
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concerning the Bay" State Furnace we have 
without number from; every State and every 
County in every State in the Union. - - T 

Sixty years of success brings with it thou­
sands of letters indicating that the Bay State 
Furnaces do all the work required of them. 

„ We have a book containing very many in­
teresting testimonial letters. It |s yours for 
the asking. -

Consult your local dealer. 

Barstaw Stove Co.* 
228 Water St.. New York 

FOUNDRIES—Providence, R. I. 
BOSTON OFFICE-56 Union fit. 9j£ 

OK* 
Stearns 
Bicycle 

4 0 

0 

is handsome, light, durable. Such grace of design as 
is embodied in this "fast, easy-running-, much-taiked-
about" mount can only be secured ly the most 
approved methods, finest material and skilled work­
manship. ' 

The f96 Stearns is the best bicycle it is possible to 
produce. Finished at your option in orange or black. 

Address now for beautiful new catalogue* 

"tbc bellow Tdtow." 
E. C. STEARNS & CO., Makers, Syracuse, N. Y. 

BUFFALO, N. V. 

H. R 

SAN FRANCISCO, CAL. TORONTO, ONT. 

0X0X0XOX0X0X0 
BULKLEY & CO., Agents, SOUTH NORWALK. 

Towle Vault Light Company. 

MANUFACTURERS. 

X -SKYLIGHTS 
1ND PATENT LIGHT DESIGNS. 

Factory: 

481 DRiGQS AVENUE, 

BROOKLYN. 

Office: 

167 ELM STREET, 

NEW YORK. 

•y^ •-
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19 Years Experience 
Just think of the wealth of wisdom and experience, 
accumulated during 19 years of building good 
bicycles, that comes to you for the $100 you pay for 

STANDARD OF THE WORLD. 
':V 

The Buyer of a Columbia has no uncertainty. He knows its 
quality and workmanship are right—the Columbia scientific 
methods ma W- them co. 

100: TO ALL ALIKE, 

I Art Catalogue of Columbia and Hartford Bicycles is free if you call upon any 
Columbia agent; by mail from us for two 2-cent stamps. 

POPE MFG. ' CO., Hartford, Conn. 
itcires end Agencies in almost every city and town. If Columbias are not 

properly represented in your vicinity, let us know. 
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FREE 
BUTTONS! 

AN 

ELEGANT BUTTON FREE 

WITH EACH PACKACE 

OF 

Sweet 
Caporal 
Cigarettes 

AN OPPORTUNITY TO 

MAKE A COLLECTION 
OF BUTTONS 
WITHOUT COST. 

HIS LAST ASCENSION. 
A NEWSPAPER MAN GOES UP IN 

A BALLOON. 

.iiitftunnnie MG-HT PARCIF.T, and LUCKWOUU * PACKAGE DELIVERY 
rhriAD raten. Will also take orders for 
Friiter s«rvi<*e in N0"' York Goods palled 

delivered tn a tt of the town 
nrdCTs re^eive^ E P. Wped's Prn* Ktoro 

Wall Street* t.Alephona <»nnnection nil* 

,30' n ^ T.OCKWOOT). 

P. w. BATES' 

42 WATER STREET, 
you can find as fine an assortment of 

itE 
As can be found in any \ ard in the 
State. Look it over and get prices 

before going elsewhere. 

W. H. HAYWARD & CO* 

P«ion Attorneys aid Solicitors, 

109 East Capitol Street, 

WASHINGTON, D. C 

All classes of claims prosecuted 

before the Interior Department. 

Rejected pension claims a specialty. 

Correspondence solicited. 

B 
RAUMIEIGER 

MIME 

A PURE MALT EXTRACT. 
A SUBSTITUTE FOR SOLID FOOD. 

Highest percentage Extract. Lowest 
percentage Alcohol. An effectiveTonic. 
An agreeable Beverage. A mild Stimu­
lant. Just what physicians will pre­
scribe for Nursing Mothers Convales­
cents and victims of Insomnia or Nerv­
ous Disorders resulting from Impaired 
Digestion and Overwork. 

For Sale and Delivered Anywhere 

Long Island Bottling Co 
280-284 Bergen St., Brooklyn. 

FOR SALE BY 

EDWARD P. WEED. 

u 

PRIVATE 
Instructions given in 

BOXING 

CLASS 
at the pupil's home. 

Now forming, and ap­

plicants desiring tfl 

join should apply at 

once to 

Prof. Ceo. Yoererer, 
South Norwalk, 

or at this office. 
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That you can save money 

by buying your Meats 
ind Fish at 

SMITH'S, 
55 Main Street 

Everything First Class. 

Wilbur W. Judd, of the Meriden, Conn., 

Kccord Staff, Attaches Himself to a 

Trapeze Bar and Sails Away. Me De­

scribes. His Sensations. 

Wilbur W. Judd of the Record staff 
:iscciuled in a balloon Mo:i<lny even­
ing from Ilanover Park. Newspaper 
men liave made balloon ascensions in 
cars or baskets attached to «. gas bs.1-
10011 managed by a practical aeronaut, 
but to manage the air-ship alone and 
to drop with a parachute is entirely 
unprecedented. About 5,000 people 
witnessed the ascension. The story 
of the tyip is told by Mr. Judd as fol­
lows: 

"The idea of going up in a balloon 
is associated in the minds of most 
people with the terrible. The aero­
naut is possibly doomed to a horrible 
death and he holds tlie fascinated at­
tention of the spectators, but I feel 
as if I had just descended from a 
serene world, as though for a few mo­
ments I had been transported into a 
clime where alluring quietude pre­
vailed. It was the pleasantest sensa­
tion, or series of sensations, that I 
ever experienced. Of course, there is 
some satisfaction in being on terra 
firma again, but it was not half so vio­
lent an act as I had anticipated. 

"It was entirely my own idea. I 
made a detailed study of the mechan­
ism of the balloon for two weeks, and 
finding Mr. Gould a very careful and 
practical man in the management of 
the graceful air globe, when he told 
me I might go up any time I chose I 
began to consider the matter more 
seriously. 

"I have never had any tendencies to­
ward the circus ring, and plebeian love 
of creating a sensation is not mine, 
but it would be a novel thing, and 
the idea of flunking never occurred to 
me. Gould Crosby and Burdette 
worked assiduously to see that every 
rope of the parachute lay on the 
ground in perfect order. At last every­
thing was ready. The balloon swayed 
with symmetrical fulness, the ropes 
at the bottom were gathered and the 
parachute attached. I got into the 
trapeze, fixed the wriyt lock, and 

snapped the catch at my belt. 
"I stood firmly on the ground. The 

word was given to let go, the balloon 
arose from above the pit, the closely 
folded parachute was drawn up from 
the ground in a taut line. It seemed 
a slow motion enough, but suddenly 
the trapeze drew me from my feet, 
and I was swept with great speed into 
space. This was the only frightful 
moment of the trip. I was dragged 
away from all things tangible; the 
earth was near so that by comparison 
I could be aware of my speed, but in 
a twinkling almost this terror left me. 
I tried to grasp by a supreme mental 
effort the facts of my condition, and I 
became contented. 

"I first looked down and saw the up­
turned faces fade instantly until I 
could no longer see anything but a 
tiny circle. Then I let go of the rope 
with my right hand, and taking off 
my cap, leaned down and waved it. 
I felt a sense of exhilaration and 
thought I heard a faint murmur of 
voices. 

"Then I looked up; the parachute 
ropes were twisted, but my weight 
caused them to unwind, and in a mo­
ment every cord hung straight from 
the folds of the parachute to the ring 
from which my trapeze was sus­
pended. I reached up and took firm 
hold of this wooden ring and moved 
more to the center of my seat. All 
feeling of fear was eradicated. 

"Now I looked down. I could not dis­
cern a human being nor a group of 
human beings. The earth was bathed 
in a translucent twilight, and it 
seemed as though far below was 
spread a wonderful carpet of soft 
green and woven with quaint patterns. 
The lake appeared very nearly under 
me; distances below were to be meas­
ured in inches. The spot of water was 
about as large as a sheet of writing 
paper. I swept the green boundary 
of the green circle with my eyes. I 
could see countless villages and sev­
eral eities and the sound. West Peak 
was like an ant hill. It is estimated 
that I ascended 4,000 feet. ' 

"A pistol shot disturbed me and I 
realized the moment to cut loose had 
come. No use to meditate on the pos­
sible results. I reached up my right 
hand, and, without allowing myself to 
think, gave the rope a quick and sharp 
pull. Everything gave way beneath 
me—I fell a dead weight probably 
over a hundred feet. I heard the 
swishing of the folds over my head; 
then a fold caught a gust of wind, 
then another, and I seemed to come to 
a sudden stop. I looked up. The 
parachute had opened and floated like 
a protecting bird overhead. It took, 
so I am told, over a minute and a half 

i to ride down. 
"As when I went up the earth seem­

ed to sink, so as I came down the 
fairy carpet danced up in the fields. 
The houses, woods and fields moved 
along in a procession. I thought I 
would land in an open meadow, but I 
passed over it. Yes, I was about to 
strike a house—I cleared it and fell 
easily through the branches of a tree. 
The parachute spread itself over the 
treetop and I hung in a swing. It was 
a small tree and I was within fifteen 
feet of the ground. It was an easy 
task to swing out and slide down the 
tree to the ground. My first and only 
ascension was over.—Meriden Record. 

: The Doctor's Diagnosis. 

Judge—"Well, ^doctor, what is the 
condition of the burglar's victim?" 

Doctor—"One of his wounds is ab­
solutely fatal, but the other two are 
not dangerous, and can be healed." 

NEWS FROM CUBA.. 

Weyler Displays Extraordinary Ability*? 
a Fake Reporter. 

"Well," inquired the Commander in 
Chief of the Spanish forces as one of 
the field officers entered the room, 
"what news?" 

"Sire!" exclaimed the officer, "I 
have to report that yesterday a body 
of nearly a thousand of our troops 
met a band of about two hundred in­
surgents fifteen miles from the city. 
W'ithin ten minutes of the time when 
they caught sight of us they were on 
the run, and"— 

"Stop!( until I can cable Spain! The 
Home dovernment must be apprised 
at once of the victory." 

"I wish to sjiy, sire, that"— 
'Silence! there will be time for that 

later;" and turning to his stenographer 
he dictated the following despatch 
from the seat of war: 

Havana,'July 'Steentli—Yesterday a 
small detachment of the Spanish army 
came suddenly upon several thousand 
of the insurgents strongly intrenched 
upon the hillside at a i^int about fif­
teen miles from this city. Though 
outnumbered ten to one, and at a dis­
advantage as regards position, the 
Spanish force quickly drove the enemy 
from their position and pursued them 
until nightfall. The Spanish loss was 
one man killed and two slightly 
wounded. The insurgent loss must 
have been tremendous, amounting, 
probably to several hundred, but in 
the darkness they succeeded in mak­
ing their escape and taking their dead 
with them. 

"Now, what was it you wanted to 
add* you tan-faced freak from the 
frontier?" gently inquired the Com­
mander in Chief. 

"I was on the point of saying, sire, 
that they were on the run toward us, 
and tliat it was only by throwing away 
our arms that we managed to escape 
with our lives." 

But by that time the despatch was 
ready to be sent, and, inasmuch as it 
was correct in the main point that two 
forces had met, Weyler thought it 
hardly worth while to make the other 
minor changes. 

THE DRAWBACKS OF GREATNESS. 

That Is, of Foreign Greatness—Our Own 
Has None. 

Of all the potentates of the earth, 
the Czar of Russia is probably the 
most powerful and absoltite, as well 
as the richest. And yet when he un­
dertook to accompany his young wife 
on a visit to her royal grandmother 
in England, he did so under condi­
tions which the humblest of his Sub­
jects would not be willing to accept. 

The mere announcement of his in­
tention was followed by unusual ac­
tivity among the police of two na­
tions, with the not unnatural result 
of the discovery of a conspiracy to 
blow him up with dynamite. We 
may hope and even believe that the 
conspiracy existed only in the imag­
ination of the police, but the British 
authorities were obliged to give the 
intended victim the benefit of the 
doubt. The poor Czar was guarded 
as closely as if. he were invading a 
hostile country, and the precautions 
taken to secure his safety were such 
as to make him feel at home in the 
most painful sense»of the word. 

What a contrast between the ruler 
of Russia taking his vacation between 
two lines of guards and the Chief 
Magistrate of our Republic playing 
lone fisherman in the quiet and se­
clusion of Buzzard's Bay! 

Spider Architecture. 

No one who has spent much time in 
the country can have failed to observe 
and admire the beautiful webs of the 
little garden spider. These webs, cir­
cular in outline, with radiating threads 
running from centre to circumfer­
ence and supporting a system of con­
centric lines, are regarded by natu­
ralists as the highest architectural 
achievement of spiders. The maker 
of the web sits at its centre, where 
the slightest vibration caused by the 
struggles of an entangled victim is 
instantaneourly felt. The threads are 
so fine as to be almost invisible in 
some lights, and at the same time so 
strong that no insect not too powerful 
for the spider to overcome is able to 
break them. 

The great ingenuity and perfection 
of these geometrical webs naturally 
jjjve rise to the question, How did the 
spider *iearn the art of making them? 
The naturalist is not satisfied with tne 
reply that it is a matter of instinct. 
He finds that there are wide differ­
ences among the webs of different spi­
ders, and his observations lead him 
to think that he can discern a sort of 
progress, which he calls evolution, in 
the art of web-making among spiders. 

Tbe common house spider spins a 
web quite different from that of the 
garden spider. The * house spider's 
web consists of a silver tube hidden 
in a dark corner with an irregular 
sheet of closely woven meshes spread 
before it. The tube is the spider's 
lurking-hole and place of refuge; the 
outspread web is its snare. 

The wolf-spider makes a tubular 
hole wijtli a hinged door for a refuge, 
and spreads no snare. Still another 
species of spider constructs a far sim­
pler tube of silk without any lid or 
door. 

Their Popularity Explained. • 
"I thought he admired large 

men," he said. 
"That's what he always said," 

answered. 
"And yet he married a little bit of 

a thing," he persisted. 
"Does that surprise you?" she in­

quired. 
"Certainly, when he admired——" 
"Oh, that has nothing to do with it," 

she explained, showing some con­
tempt for his ignorance. "Lots or 
men admire large women, but they 
don't pick out that kind to boss 
around."—Chicago Post. , 
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For the Company 
Today In Wilmington, Del. I 

BOSTON, Oct. 17.—The expeoted has 
happened. A receiver, S. Augustas Mo-
.Caulley, president of the Artisan Savings 
"bank of Wilmington, Del., has been ap­
pointed for the Bay State Gas company of 
Delaware, which controls the entire gas 
plant of Boston. 

The appointment was made in Wilming­
ton today. The announcement reached 
this city soon aftqr the opening of the 
Btock market and the stock, already weak, 
broke to t.he lowest point on record. 

The receivership is the result of hearings 
that have been in progress for some days 
past and the outgrowth of the long stand­
ing differences between the various inter­
ests controlling the gas situation. 

NEW YORK, Oot. 17.—In some quarters 
in this city the application for a receiver 
was regarded a6 a political move in the 
fight for the Republican senatorship in 
Delaware. The application was made, it is 
said, by ex-Senator Higgins on behalf of 
William Buchanan of Buchanan & Lyall, 
tobacconists, an income bond holder. The 
order Is returnable Nov. 7—that is, four 
davs after the election. 

There has been talk in Wall street for 
some time of a receivership for the Bay 
State Gas oompany, and its stock has sold 
down steadily from in the twenties to 
the low point whioh was reached today on 
the announcement of the receivership. 
There is, however, little interest in the 
stock in this market, and the dealings in 
it have, never been large* the transactions 
in the .two forenoon hours-today being un­
der 3,000 shares. 

The authorized issue under the mort­
gage of 1889 was $13,000,000, of which 
$7,000,000 is secured by the Mercantile 
Trust company, a trustee of nearly all the 
stock of the Boston, South Boston, Hox-
bury and Bay State (of Massachusetts) 
Gas Light company of Boston, the report­
ed cost of which to the company was $10,-
000,000. Of the balance ($5,000,000) $3,-
000,000 was reserved for betterments and 
improvements and $3,000,000 to acquire 
control of other gas companies. An annu­
al sinking fund of 1 per cent of the entire 
issue was provided for, and bonds can be 
drawn at 105. All bonds issued are de­
posited with the Mercantile Trust com­
pany, New York, which issued its Boston 
gas trust certificates. 

EMIGRANTS DECEIVED. 

Further Government Discouragement of 
Their Going to Brazil. 

MONTREAL, Oct. 17. — The Brazilian 
consul and the agent of the steamship line 
running between Canada and Brazil have 
called upon R. W. Scott, aoting Dominion 
minister of the interior, and urged the 
government to withdraw its opposition to 
Canadian emigration to Brazil, as they 
have made arrangements for taking an­
other lot to Brazil. Mr. Scott replied that 
the government would do anything in its 
power to prevent Canadians leaving the 
country, and certainly would discounte­
nance emigration to Brazil. Information 
received by the government bears out the 
prediction made at Montreal at the time 
of the departure of the Canadian emi­
grants to Brazil, and in view of the avowed 
efforts of the steamship line and of the 
Brazilian republic to secure another 
oargo of Canadians the publication of the 
fact that bogus promises were made and 
no preparation made to receive the emi­
grants will serve as an effective warning 
to those who think of bettering their con­
dition in Brazil. 

Killed While Fooling. ' 

MARLBORO, Mass., Oct.. 17.—J. R. Mc­
Donald, a shoemaker, about 36 years of 
age, was found dead in a blood stained bed 
at his boarding place here today. Shortly 
afterward Michael Cahill, also of this oity, 
gave himself up to t>he police, stating that 
while fooling with McDonald last night 
he accidentally cut McDonald. 

Faderewskf. 
NEW YORK, Oot. 17.—The rumor ftaat 

Ignace J. Paderewskl, the Polish pianist, 
had gone insane has been denied by his 
intimate friends in this country, foremost 
among whom is Mr. Charles F. Tretbar, 
who, when seen at Steinway hall, charac­
terized the report as a hoax. 

Slack Briggs Again a Winner. < 
LONDON, Oct. 17.—Mr. Enoch Wishard's 

American horse Mack Briggs won the 
Southfleld Plate at Newmarket today in a 
field of four startera 

Weather Forecast. 
Fair; slightly cooler; westerly winds. 

FINANCIAL AND COMMERCIAL. 

Closing Quotations of the New York 

NEW YORK, Oct. 16.—Money on call firm^at 
6®6H per cent. Prime mercantile paper, nomi­
nally 8@9 per cent. Sterling exchange steady, 
with actual business in bankers' bills at $4.83% 
@4.84 for demand and S4.80?£@4.81 for 60 days. 
Posted rates, $4.81i6@4.83 and S4.84*£@4.85. 
Commercial bills, $4.79^. Silver certificates, 
sales, $17,000 *t 65Mi@35^c. Bar silver, 66«c. 
Mexican dollars, 60>^c. Government bonds 
firm. State bonds dull. Railroad bauds firm. 

Closing prices: 
Atchison 
Bur. & Quincy.. 
C., C., C. & St. L. 22 
Chesapeake & O.. 14 
Chicago Gas 

St 
New England 
N. J. Central 
North American.. 
Northern Pacific. 
Do. pref 
N. Y. Ce Central.. 

& We 
Mail.. 

53I 
Cotton Oil 14Vi 
Del. & Hudson...132^ 
Distillers' Trust.. — 
Erie 13% Heading 
General Electric. 26% Hock Island 
Hocking Valley.. 16»4 Silver Bullion... 
Lackawanna 156 St. Paul 
Lake Shore 144 Sugar Refinery. 
Lead SO Texas Pacific.... 
Louisville & Nash 4$£ Union 
Missouri Pacific.. 19 Wabai 
North 

pret 14 
Union... 88 

NEW YORK, Oct. 16.-FLOUR-I 
western strong and held higher, which < 
demand; city mills patents, 
patents, $3.95@4.16: city mills clears, 

May, 

straights. $3.60@3.75. 
WHEAT—No. 2 red opened strong and ex­

cited on higher cables, eased off under realiz­
ing, but again advanced at noon on com 
strength abroad; December, 77%@79c.; 
80?*@815$c. 

CORN—No. 2 opened stronger with 
and on export demand, later easing off; De­
cember, 32@32%c.; May, 34^@35c. 

OATS—No. 2 quiet, but firmei 
25Hs@259£c.; track, white, state. 20@30J6c. 

family, $10.60 

LARD—Firm; prime western Jsteam, $4.60, 

When love 
kno c k s  a t  a  w o -
m&n's. heart he 
usually comes in 
disguise. Doesn't 
w a n t  i t  k n o w n  
what he's up to. 
If she knew all 
a b o u t  t h e  l i t t l e  
rascal, would she 

let him in? That's a question. 
Women are apt to look upon 

love and marriage as purely 
a matter of sentiment and af­
fection. That is 
right; yet there 
side to it too; and the 
to preserve the ideal aspect 
marriage and maternity is not 
to forget the practical part of 
it. A woman cannot be a thor­
oughly happy wife and mother 
unless the distinctive physical 
organism of her sex is in a 
healthy and vigorous condi­
tion. The best friend that wo­
man ever had is the "Favorite 
Prescription," of. Dr. R. V. 
Pierce, Chief Consulting Phy-
sician of the Invalids' Hotel 
and Surgical Institute, Buffalo, 
N. Y. The "Prescription," ia 

a perfect and infallible remedy for every 
form of " female weakness." "cures by 
restoring health and strength to the inter-

CaDr°U^rce"sTmitient reputation as a phy­
sician of wide learning; and his special 
knowledge of the delicate and intricate or­
ganism of women, accounts for the unpar­
alleled confidence, which women place in 
his "Favorite Prescription," over every 
other remedy. Its use obviates the neces­
sity of dreaded '' examinations and the 
stereotyped " local treatments.' 

Dr. R. V. Pierce, Dear SirI sufi 
years with female weakness, ner 
general debility, trying everything _ 
to help me—all to no avail. I then heard 
Dr. Pierce's medicines and although I was thor 
oughiy discouraged, I thought I would try oiic* 
more to find relief. I took your Golden Medica^ 
Discovery" and "Favorite Prescription,»jandto< 
great praise cannot be given for the rapid relief 

rave me. I am now free from the forme 
Very sincerely yours, 

they ga 
troubles 

(Mrs.) 
Box 46, Saratoga. 

Santa Clara Co.. Ca. 

CENTRAL NATIONAL BANK 
26 WJ.ZZ ST., NOR WALK. 

'876. 
$100.00C 

H. E. DANN, 
J. T. PEOWITT 
S. H. HOLMES, 

CORPORATED SEPT. 1, 
CAPITAL, - - - . . , 
GEORGE M. HOLMES, President. 

E. L. BOTES, Vice-President. 
WILLIAM A. CUBTIS, Cashier. 

DIRECTORS: 
GEOBGE M. HOLMES, 
P. L. CUNNINGHAM, 
E. L. BOYEB, 

J. COUSINS, JB. 

Discount Day, Saturday. 

DAVID . W, RAYMOND 
<* 

Funeral Director and Maimer 
39J WasMrgtfn Mreet'Sonlh ffonralk 

Ro«idencp. Mahackemo Hotel. v 

Department 

WORD 
TO 
THE 

WISE 
Merchants, Manuiaoiw 

ers, Lodges and Societies 

will consult their own inter­

ests by giving us a call. 

REMEMBER—If you have 

work to do, write to us. 

Just one mis­

take and we are 

hurt. 

Our 
Reputation 
Is 
Pot 
In 
Our 
Instruments. 

SCHLEICHER & SON 

That is the Reason 

why 

P I A N O S  
ABE WHAT THEY ABE. 

HONEST WORK AT AN HONESTPRICE 
Let as build you a piano to match you 

furniture. Come and see our factory. 

Pianos Said or. Easy Terms and Old Ones Taken 
Exchange. Factory: Pacific St., Stamford. 

BUTTER—Steady; state dairy, 10J£@17c.; 

BtCOIESE-Qii^rtate, large, 7@10c.; small, 

7<EGGS—Steady; state and Pennsylvania, 20c.; 
western, 15@18$£c. 

SUGAR-Raw w % 

TALLOW—Dull; city, 3«c.; country 

if yt' - 7  •  - v  
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THE EVENING GAZETTE 

NTRREL' AX THE POST OFFICE 

at 4iL S UBScjtiPxioys: 
i 

DAILY, oue year. $3; sixjnontiis, $1.75; three 
months. $1.00; onelmonth, 30E. 

WEEKLY, one! year, ia ^advance.'$1.00; six 

Months, 60c.; three months, 35c. 

SATURDAY, OCTOBER 17, 1896. 

THE WEATHER—Forecast for to­
day. Cloudy ia the momingr, becom­
ing fair; cooler, and northwesterly 
wiudp, followed by killing frosts. On 
Sunday, fair, cooler, with fresh north­
westerly winds; and on Monday fair 
weather, with rising temperature. 

Hon. Thomas W. Ferry. 

The death of ex-Senator Thomas W. 
Ferry recalls one of the central figures 
of the great presidential contest of 1876-
'77, but who soon thereafter passed into 
retirement and has been almost forgot­
ten by the people of the present. 

Ferry was not a man of great acquire­
ment or force, but he happened to hold 
the key to the solution of the president­
ial question in the battle between Til-
den and Hayes, which resulted in the 
formation of the Electoral Commission 

and finally the seating of J Hayes. 
His importance at* the time as presi­

dent of the Senate was intensified by 
the fact that his position was, at first, 
regarded as somewhat doubtful on the 
great issue, but honors were piled upon 
him and he held to bis party fidelity. 
When the strain was over, however, 
he was defeated for re-election, and 
since then has been unknown and nn-

felt in the politics of either his State or 

the nation. 
Ferry but repeated the experiences 

of thousands of our meteoric, political 
statesmen. Peace to his asher. 

than see tha Union perish, he offers np 
his wife and children upon the altar of 

possible . contingency, and flatters 
himself .that the fruit, if any, will be 
recorded to his everlasting credit. 
This accounts largely for the scarcity 
of men in the churches—a scarcity that 
ia noticable iu everv church in every 
city, town and hamlet, and more espec­
ially iu the large cities. 

Every Sunday witnesses devoted 
Christian wives at their places in the 
church offering up heartfelt thanks to 
Heaven and kneeling in sublime con­
fidence to the only eternal God, while 
their husbands lounge and sleep at 
home or indulge in more reprehensibe 
eDjoymeni, under the comforting con­
viction that their souls are being taken 
care of in the most approved manner, 
and that a vicarious statement has been 
made sufficient to cover all their spirit 

ual needs. 

•--H-

Annual Encampment. 

The fifth annual encampment of the 
Union Veterans' pnion was held in 
Bridgeport; T^uriday, when the fol­
lowing officers were elected: Depart 
ment commander, Colonel W. E. Mor 
gan, New Haven; first department com­
mander, J. L'flpmmedieu, Sou'h Nor-
walk; second department commander, 
GeorgeS. Cleveland, Meriden; chap­
lain, Thomas Chadeayne, Shelton; 
surgeon general, Jonathan W. Byrnep, 
Bridgeport; executive board, Albert 
W. Cook, Meriden; Cnarles VS\ Wat 
rous, Bridgeport; James Goodwin, New 
Haven; L. V. B. Hubbard, Shelton; 
Charles Smith, South Norwalk; L. T. 
Hurd, Bridgeport; Lawrence O'Brien, 
Ivew Haven. A collation followed the 
election. 

Vicarious Piety. 

There is too much vicarious piety in 
the world. The many rely upon the 
few to bring them safely into the prom­
ised land. Statistics show that two-
thirds of the church members of the 
United States are women. This speaks 
well for the puri j nil goodness of the 
womeD, but it doea uot speak so well 
for the sense of the men who imagtue 
that they can be paved by pros? and 
are under no obligation to make aDy 

direct eff *rt to save themselves.; , 
The country is full of men—genei ally 

married men-who ne\er go to church, 
but who, believing in the church as a 
means of grace and in religion as a fit­
ting preparation for another world, are 
glad that their wives belong to the 
church an l steadfastly encourag6 them 
in the performance of their Christian 

duties. 
During the late'civil war many men 

who had a direct interest in the preser­
vation of the Union and were full of 
patriotism in the abstract were so con­
stituted that, in preference to taking 
an op8u part ou the field of battle and 
thus risking the perilous entertainment 
of a piece of lead iu the nerves and 
tissues of their bodies, they served 

vicariously, sending to the froftt, in 
their places substitutes, whose lova of 
ncre outweighed their fear of persona', 

ibjury. 
In like manner men of the present 

day select as religious substitutes the 
wives of ^ftir bosoms aDd send them to 
church t j do battle with Satm for both 

their SOUIF. 
Many a man, when with his comrades 

and around the festive board, is in­
clined to laugh at the idea of a hearaft^r 
and has nothing whatever to do yvith 
the church and its many fields of reli­
gious eff >rt—personally. But with the 
vagne fear that perhaps his diagnosis of 
a future state may be wrong, ho hedges. 
That is, lie eucoarages his wife to go to 
church and send his children to Sunday 
school. He offers up a v'carious sacri­
fice for hi? own sins, and goea on with 
the fiiuaing while the sacrifice is being 

accomplished. 
Bringing down to a gross, Dersonal, 

se'fiih plane the Sublime Sicrifice of 
Calvary and arguing on"the hypothesis 
that, as Christ atoned for all, so in these 
Utter days may the same course be al-
allowable, he hugs to his heart the belief 
that his wife's Christianity will be broad 
enough to cover him also, and that he 
may be able to smuggle lr'maelf through 
the narrow gates in tli9 shadow of her 

devotion. 
In his extreme self-conceit and sel­

fishness he takes his wife's action unto 
himself and deludes himself finally in'o 
the belief that he is the Christian and 
his wife merely an automaton of which 

he pulls the strings 
Like the man who was willing to 

sacrifice all his wife's relatives sooner 

Mrs. Hick's Motion. 

There was on the list yesterday, be­
fore Judge Shumway, at the Superior 
Court, in New Haven, a motion made 
by Mrs. Isabelle Hicks in her suit for 
divorce from ex-Representative Rat-
cliffe Hicks, of Tolland. She charges 
her husband with infidelity, and this 
morning, through her counsel, Harri­
son & Zacher, asked to ba allowed ali­
mony pendins; the trial of the divorce 
case. She alleges that he is wealthy 
and that he should provide for her sup­
port pending the hearing. 

Ex Judge Harrison announced, how­
ever, that at the request of the counsel 
for the defendant, he h*d agreed to 
postpone the hearing. 

Case of Brutality. 

Dr. W. H. Donalson of Fairfield, an 
.agegjt of tHie^JELumaue Society has in­
vestigated the case of Frank Lockwcod, 
a Greenfield Hill farmer, who attends 
the Congregational church there three 
times every Sunday. He finds that he 
has cruelly treated his sister-in-law, 
Jennie Rowe, aged 25 and not very 
bright. Recently he branded her face 
with a red hot poker and locked her in 
a room without food or w iter'for thirty-
six hour?, it is charged. Dr. Donald­
son, after investigating, sent Lock-
wood word to come and see him and 
if he does not he will be arrested. 

Rice's Comedians. 

"Rice's Comedians have just played 
a week's engagement at my bouse, and 
have not only done the largest reper­
toire business ever known herp, but 
have given by far the bett perform­
ances we have ever had at cheap 
prices." 

H. C. DENNIS, 
Manager Opera House, 

Asbury Park, N. J. 
October 5tb, 1896. 
Rice's Comedians will be at the Nor­

walk Opera House all next week. 

THE EVENING 
.  . .  '  ;  v  '  "  ' ' '  '  .  • :  

CHECKER-BOARD ̂ BUSINESS DIRECTORY. 

NORWALK 

Fire Insurance Co. 
In Successful Oper­

ation Since 1860, 

The little daughter of Mr. Fred Webber 
Holland, Mass., had a very bad cold and 
cough which he had not been able to cure 
w ith anything. I gave him a 25 cent bottle 
of Chamberlain's Cough Remedy, says W. P. 
Holden, merchant and postmaster at West 
Brimfield, and the next time I saw him he 
said it worked like a charm. This remedy 
is intended especially for acute throat and 
lung diseases such as_ colds, croup and 
whooping cough, and it is famous for its 
cures. There is ho danger in giving it to 
children for it contains nothing injurious. 
For sale bv E. I'. Weed, druggist. 

Advertised Letters. 

The following letters remain uncalled 
for at the Norwalk Pus Office, October 
17tb: . 

Harry W. Frary, Mies Mary E. Gil-
man, Mrs. Charlotte E. Main, S. V. 
Parker, Mrs. M. Prchin, Mrs. Mamie 
Winterer. 

W. H. MALONE, P. M. 

5 -  >  "  

Hoe Cholera's Ravages. 
DUBUQUE, Ia., Oct. 17.—Scotfc Eenson, 

commercial agent of the Illinois Central 
Railway company, has sent in his report 
as to ravages of hog cholera along the 
Central's lines in Iowa. He reports a loss 
of 10 per cent of hogs from Jessup to Fort 
Dodga. It prevails at Alden, Iowa Falls, 
Williams, Blairsburg and other points, the 
loss heing. fully 50 per cent. -

Mascacni and Leoncavallo. 

NEW YORK, Oct. 17.—The distinguished 
composer of "Cavalleria Rusticana," Pie-
tro Mascagni, is coming to this country, 
and with him will be Ruggiero Leonoa-
vallo. Ernile Durer is now in this city 
making arrangements for a series of grand 
concerts to be conducted by the masters 
during November, December and January. 

Quina Arrested For Forgery. 
Los ANGELES, Cal., Oct. 17.—George T. 

Qulnn, wanted In New York for forgery, 
was arrested here. Quinn raised a check 
and then left the east. He has been in hid­
ing since his arrival in California. 

.* 

G. Ward Selleck, 
• BEST GOODS, 

TEAS and COFFEES 

18 WALL ST. 

Frank T. Hyatt 

DENTIST, 

8 West Ayenue. 

GAZETTE ADS. 

BRING 

GOOD RESULTS 

Safes For Rent. 
VALUABLES STORED 

IK 
Safe Deposit Vault 

OF THE 
NATIONAL BANK 

OF NORWALK, 

TRHS! TREES! TAEES! 
Call at 58 Belden 

Avenue, if you are go­
ing-to set out trees 
this fall. All stock 
warranted to lire. 

Edf /  i r  But tery ,  
58 Belden Ave. 

25 years foreman of 
Hoyts' Nurseries. 

•••it il« 

ENTERPRISE 

Bottling Works, 
7 Wall Street. 

FIRE A«S AND LAGER 
EXPBESSLY FOB FAH-

' ILY USE. 
Mail orders receive 

prompt attention. . . 

EMBOSSING 
DONE 'AT 

THIS 0FF1GF. 

TRY 

WEED'S 

SODA WATER 
38 Wall St. 

• ! --

PARLOR 

BARBER-l-SHOP, 
H. S. LEOBOLD. 

47 Main Street. 

. ;.f i: 

i': 
• - -

W.H.BYIN8T0N 

1HS JBANCEt 
Rni li EuctU Miinj, 

Painting, Paper 
Hanging, Kalsomin-
infe arid Hardwood 
finishing, 

G. L. PLATT, 
52 Wilton Avenue, 

Norwalk, Conn. 
Send for book con-

taiaing samples. 

Job Printing 
OF 

EVERY DESCRIPTION 

EXECUTED AT THE '• 

GAZETTE OFFICE 

•:.a 

Beyond toonDt. 

Among the many good things told 
some years ago of Colonel "Utley, well 
known as a Wisconsin editor, and also 
as the hero of more than one military 
story, is a little incident which illus­
trates fcis ability to majie a good-na­
tured joke. 

During the war, while Colonel Utley 
was in command of a Wisconsin regi­
ment stationed in Kentucky, he at­
tained some notoriety by allowing his 
men to harbor and protect a poor 
negro boy who had escaped from his 
master. The boy came north and the 
master brought suit for his value 
against Colonel Utley. 

One day the colonel went from his 
home to Milwaukee, and while there 
he met a friend who asked him how 
his case was progressing. 

"Very well," replied the Colonel. "I 
think I shall win it, although I have 
the smartest lawyer at the Milwau­
kee bar against me." 

"Why, he isn't our smartest lawyer 
by any means," said the friend, with 
evident surprise. 

"Oh, certainly he is," responded the 
colonel, with conviction. 

"How do you know?" persisted his 
friend. 

"Know! Why, man alive, he ac­
knowledged it himself!" 

A Suit for Every Day. 

Studentus—"Young Herman has a 
suit of clothes for every day in the 
week." V 

Studentum—"I never see him 
but one." 

Studentus—"Yes; that's the suit!" 

wear 

Positive Proof. 

Miss Daisy Medders—Do you love 
me, Jason? 

Jason Huckleberry—'Course I love 
you. Do you s'pose I'd have been 
actin' the fool over you all this time 
If I didn't? 

Mere Euphemism. 

Willie—Popper, wJhat does this book 
mean by saying that the King took 
the lion's share? 

Mr. Ferry—It is a polite way of say­
ing that he acted like a hog.—Cincin­
nati Enquirer. 

A Theory. 

"Was it whiskey that brought you 
aere?" asked the prison visitor. 

"I think, lady, from the way the 
copper smelled," answered Dismal 
Dawsoli, "that it was gin."—Indian­
apolis Journal. 

The Old Sort. 

Ethel—How did Blanch manage to 
get a husband? 

Maud—She utilized a matrimonial 
agency. 

Ethel—You don't say so! Which 
agency? 

Maud—A hammock.—Pick-Me-Up. 
j--: • /> 

v:>\; 

, T E A ,  C O F F E E  AND SUGAR. 

Differences in the Averages of Consump­
tion in Various Countries. 

Tweaty ounces a year for each, in­
habitant has been the average of tea 
consumption in the United States for 
twenty-five years. England's aver­
age for the same period has been 80 
ounces for each inhabitant, or four 
times greater. Tea drinkers, as a 
rule, use more sugar than coffee 
drinkers do. Tea-drinking countries 
are the greatest consumers of sugar. 
In Spain, where chocolate is more 
popular as a drink than tea, and in 
France, where coffee is proverbially 
popular, and supposedly best made, 
sugar is, relatively, less used. 

The annual consumption of sugar 
in the United States is now 2,100.000 
tons, which is about 65 pounds a per­
son. Of the total the United States 
produces 350,000 tons, 1,800,000 being 
imported. The United States pay an­
nually over $108,000,000 for foreign 
sugar,: and 920,000,000 for the domes­
tic article. The American product of 
sugar has increased 50 per cent in 12 
year. The English consumption of 
liugar is at the rate of 70 pounds per 
capita, the average of Holland and 
Denmark being 30 pounds, and of 
France and Switzerland 23 pounds. 

The expression "enormous," often 
erroneously used by statisticians in­
tent upon establishing a proposition, 
is correct in the case of Holland as a 
coffee-consuming country, for the to­
tal consumption of coffee. in a year 
amounts to 40,000 tons, and the total 

' area of Holland is 12,000 square miles 
—less than half the state of West Vir­
ginia. On the basis of the population 
the coffee consumption of Holland is 
325 ounces yearly for each inhabitant, 
and the other countries with which 
comparison is made have the aver­
ages folloAving: United States, 150; 
Germany, 90; France, 70; Austro-
Hungary, 35; Italy, 17; Great Britain 
and Ireland, 15; Spain 9, and Russia 
3. 

The English taste for tea has never 
extended to the United States, but, 
oddly enough, in those portions of 
Canada in which the inhabitants are 
of English descent the consumption 
of tea is just as large as in either Eng­
land <fr Ireland. In tea and coffee 
drinking the United States follow 
rather France and Germany than 
England, though the reason for this 
preference is not altogether clear. 

: The Wife's Retort.* -

The infant of the house was in its 
cradle. The head of the house was at 
home, peevish and fault-finding. At 
length he became unendurable, as lie 
growled out; 

"You have done nothing tonight but 
make mistakes." -

"Yes," she answered meekly. "I 
began by--putting'the wrong baby to 

* 

' "One t/nsettled Point. 

An old man who bore evidence of 
more work than culture approached 
a representative of a free silver pa­
per the other day in the State Li­
brary. 

"Can I ask you a question?" 
"Certainly." 
"Well, if we have free silver coin­

age, we'll all have more money, won't 
.we?" 

"Why, yes, certainly; that's easy to 
answer." . -

"Well, what I want to know," said 
the old father, earnestly, " is wheth­
er they will bring it to me or whether 
I'll have to go after it." 

The Costly Lot. 

Gadsby—"Those three dude sons of 
LVan Nostrand cost him about $5,000 
a year." 

Miss Caustique—"Then lie has been 
putting a good deal of money into real 
estate." 

"How's that?" 
"He is spending §5,000 a year on a' 

vacant lot."—Brooklyn Life. 

Our Great Impressionist. 

"What do you suppose impressed Li 
Hung Chang more than anything else 
in America, Mr. Pilcher?" 

"The fact that American wives are 
BO lively that a man can't undertake 
to manage but one at a time."—Chica­
go Record. 

MEEKER COAL CO, 

COAL, WOOD, BRICK, 
* v 

LIME, CEMENT, TILE PIPE. , 

OFFICE WITH G. WABD SELLECK 

WALL STfiEET. NOB Wi LK. 

PLYMOUTH ROCK ICE. 

Stores and Families Supplied. 
Lowest Bates. 

Piano XiGssonSj 
1^8. GEORGE W. BRADLEY, (daughter 
JxL of the late Wa, S. Nash,) gives efficent 
and satisfactory instructions on the Piano at 
ber home No. 193 Main atreei. 

TO THE PEOPLE OF NORWALK 
The undersigned having purchased the Plumbing and Tin-

ning business formerly conaupied by Wm. P. Holmes at zJ\o. 
7 IVater street, and fitted the same as a first-class Plumbing, 
Steam-fitting, Gas and Tinning Establishment, respectfully 
solicit a share of public patronage 

All work will have our personal supervision and inspect-
ion, and ke executed wite promptness and thoroughness. */lhy 
cne wanting first-class work done at the lowest prices, will do 
well to give us a call. . We will cheerfully estimate on all 
Plumbing, Gass- fitting, Steam-fitting, Tin and Sheet Iron work 
of every descriptions. - ; ^ ;v 

Ml Jobbing will be attended to promptly. Hot air and 
steam heaters cleaned and put in thorough repair. Call or ad­
dress, - . .v 

PfflLLIPSON & BROWN, 
Practical Pluto, Steam & Gas litters, Tin anil Stat Iron Mere. 1? 

':•/ 
• 

.7 Water Street, Nerwalk. 

/it V, 
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HERE ANDJHERE. 
An Epitome of Happenings of 

of Interest to the Public. 

Garnered With Scissors and Pencil. 

About 800 applications "to be made" 
voters have been tiled in Stamford. 

Thomas L»vdan of Winnipauk has 
applied for a fall liqior license. 

—Call at Gresory's Wall street mar­
ket 

Mr. George B. Oowles was out this 
morning convalescent of a savere ill­

ness. 

A letter received to d^y from the 
Adirondacks, states that Frank I. Jones 
is not as well. 

—Westport and Nor walk smelt, fish, 
oysters, eucalopa and clams9 all fresht 
at Gregory's Wall street market. 

There will be an inspection of Buck­
ingham Post, Wednesday evening, Oc­
tober 21st. A collation will be served. 

Elder A. H. Parsons will conduct the 
services at the Saints' chapel in Broad 
River, to morrow morning and evening. 

Prof, and Mrs. Charles F. Olney of 
•Cleveland, Ohio, former parishioners of 
JRev. Dr. Noble are guests at the Con­
gregational Parsonage. 

A luncheon will be served from 12 to 
3 o'clock at the Woman'* Exchange, 
Thursday. There will be a sale of 
fancy articles afternoon and evening. 

Messrs. Artemas W. Noble, Arthur 
J. Gray. Charles H. Whitlock and 
Franklin Steveas have applied for li­
cense to sell intoxicants in New Canaan. 

Mr. Albert Brinkerhof, of New Ca-
naau, caught his carriage wheel in one 
of thd trolley car tracks on the bridge, 
yesterday eueiiing, with the result of a 
broken axle. -

George J. Underwood, Henry F. 
Penuoyer, William T. Williams and 
John P. McCann have applied for li­
censes to sell intoxicants in Westport. 
And there will be others. 

South Norwalk. 
Branch Office of GAZETTE No. 12 

North Main Street 

The Saints new Cuapel at Broad 
River is nearly completed. The paint­
ers will complete their work within 
two or three dajs and they are the last 
in the matter of the completion of the 
Chapel. __ 

A descendeiit of Rev. Thomas Han-
ford, the first Minister in Norwalk, has 
been visiting hdre the past week, and 
lias given and received much informa­
tion regarding his clerical ancestors. 

. Yesterday different streets in our 
city and town were traversed by home 
and foreign agents, throwing hand-bills 
into people's yards, on their stoops, etc. 
in direct violation of the law. Nine 
different circulars and adv. sheets were 
thrown in upon one reuident's stoop on 
Belden avenue. 

At The Churches. 

^GBACE CHUBCH, Rav. S. H. Watkins, 
Rectar. St. Luiea' D<iy, Sunday Oct. 
18. 8 a. m. Huly Communion. 30.30 
a. m. Morning Prayer, Jjitauy, and 
sermon. 12 m. SundaySchool. 7.3) p. 
m. Evening Prayer and sermon. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH,—F. E. Rob-
bins, Pastor. Sunday morning the 
Pastor will preach upon 'Translated, 
Transformed aud Transferred, or the 
Wonders of Grace." In the even­
ing the Subject will be "Who is on the 
Lord's Side, Let Him Come." Young 
people's meeting 6:30. Subject, ''Bles­
sings and Dangers of Prosperity." 
Deut., 8 13-20. 

METHODIST CHURCH.—Rev. A. H. 
Wyatt will preach morning and even­
ing. Subjects—'"To Get or To Give— 
which?" "The First Gospel Preaching 
in Europe," Services at 10:33 and 7:30. 
A cordial welcome. 

FIRST CONGREGATIONAL CHURCH.— 
Rev. Thomas K. Noble, Pastor. Ser­
vices at 10:30 a. m. and 7:30 p. m. 
In the morning Rev. Jabtz Backus will 
occupy the pulpit. In the evening there 
will be "A Lincoln Memorial Service." 
The Pastorjwill &peak upon "Abraham 
Lincoln and Some of the Lessjns of his 
Noble Life." Y. P. S. C. E. at 6 30 p. 

O. S. Ferry Commaud, U. V. U., 
held a meeting last night. 

Lincoln Council, O. U. A. M., held a 
meeting last night in their rooms^ on 
Washington street. 

Thomas E. Perkins will give his sec­
ond organ recital in the Congregation­
al church this afternoon at 4 o'clock. 
Mrs. W. F. A-nbler, soprano, will act 
as soloist. 

Eureka Lodge, Daughters of Re-
bekab, held a meeting in their haH over 
Hoyi's Theatre last night and worked 
the initiatory degree on several candi­
dates. 

It is understood that the Norwalk 
Lock factory will on Monday next start 
up with a fill compliment of help. 
The old time of nine hours a day and 
five days a wefifc Will be resumed. 

A convention of the cyclists of towns 
in the 13th senatorial district will be 
held in this city io the near future. 
George H. Yosburgh, jr., the president 
of the district, will call the convention 
for the* purpose of forming a division 
of the newly organized State confeder­
ation of Connecticut cyclists. 

While playing a game of foot-ball 
with his college team, of Bordeutown, 
N. J., Guy Lee son of M iyor M. M. 
Lee, fractured his knee cap. The acci­
dent happened about three weeks ago. 
Since that tima Guy has been oonfined 
in the hospital at Trenton and is liable 
to remain thare for some time as the 
injured member heals very slowly. 

Those who listened to Miss Elizabeth 
W. Yates when she visited our city two 
years ago,remember well her magnetic 
presence and persuasive eloquence. 
Such friends can retflily believe ft re­
joices the Young Women's Christian 
Temperance Uuion to be able to give to 
one and all a secoud opportunity to 
hear this most charming speaker. 
"Truth Stranger Than Fiction" will be 
the subjsc: of an address which will be 
given by Miss ¥ates in the Congrega­
tional church on next Wednesday even­
ing. 

James Hall, son of Landlord Hall, of 
the City Hotel, celebrated his 12th 
birthday last evening;by giving a party 
to his many friends. The young boys 
and girls began to arrive at five o'clock 
and departed at nine after having ex­
perienced a very enjoyable time. Those 
present were the Mu-ses Florence Lock-
wood, Eleaa Force, Katie Brown, Ma­
bel Hamilton, Lillie Holeman, Dora 
Heine. Yeriua Heine, Annie Steegmul-
ler, Edna Richards, Aanie Pearson, 
Susie Ufzinger, Nellie Trowbridge, 
Grace Wilmot, Miv Williams, Mar-
euerike Williume, Ella Cook, Mamie 
Bernard, Frances Bernard, Eva Col­
lins 'and Grace Collins. The Masters 
Joseph Goodwin, victor Goodwin, 
Steven Goodwin, Fred ForeJ, Clarence 
Brown, George Smith, Aaron Coburn, 
George William?, Eddie O'Brien, Rob 
ert Steegmuller, Fred Cook and Eddy 
Cook. The guests partook of one of 
Landlord Hali's famous repasts. 

sMl: last' winter Mr/Geo.VAr Mill&, _ of 
Lebanon,$ Conn.,1 was badly afflicted -with 
rheumatism.^ At times it was so severe that 
he could not stand up straight, but was 
drawn over on one side. * "I tried different 
remedies without receiving relief," lie says, 
"until about six months ago I bought a bot­
tle of Chamberlain's Pain Balm. After using 
it for three days my rheumatism jras gone 
and has not returned since/^ For sale by E. 
P. Weed, druggist. "" ~ ^ 

One Way of Putting It. 

The Southern Bivouac quotes a story 
of a negro, John Williams, who, filled 
with zeal for his master's cause, ac­
companied a Georgia regiment to the 
army of General Floyd. The cam­
paign was unsuccessful, and J(|fin, be­
coming homesick, was allowed to de­
part. Before starting he went to say 
good-by to the general. "So you are 
going to leave us, John?" said Gen­
eral Floyd. "Yes, Marse Floyd. It 
'pears like I can do" no more good at 
home now dan bein' here; so I 
thought I'd go home and 'courage up 
our people to hold on." 

"That's right, John. But are you 
going to tell 'em you left us running 
from the Yankees?" "No, sir—no, 
Marse Floyd, dat I ain't. You may 
'pend on my not tellin' nothin' to 
'moralize dem people." But how will 
you get around telling them, John?" 
"Easy 'nough, Marse Floyd. It won't 
do to 'moralize dem people. I'm goin' 
to tell 'em dat when I lef' de army it 
was in firs'-rate sperrits, an' dat, owin' 
to de situation ob de country an' de 
way de lan' lay, we was advancin' 
backward an' de Yankees was a re-
treatin' for'awd." 

vGettins Pat; n?s. • \ 
If you look back on the history of 

'human progress you will lind that 
none of the great epoch-making inven­
tions has ever been patented. .1 lie man 
who lit the first fire—whether Pr me-
theus or the party from whom he stole 
the idea—did not get a patent for it. 
Neither did the man who made the 
first wheel—in every seuse one of the 
most revolutionary inventions in the 
history of man. The same tiling may 
be said of the invention of soap, can­
dles, gunpowder, umbrellas and the 
mariner's,compass, or, to come to our 
own day, of the steam engine and the 
electric telegraph. 

Patents are mostly concerned with 
small mechanical details and improve­
ments—it may be in the application 
of steam and electricity and by means 
of these patents "enormous profits 
have been secured to second-rate in­
ventors; but the great ideas and dis­
coveries which underlie these , details 
have been given to the world gratis. 

There is a general notion that if you 
did not protect inventions by means 
of patents, inventors would cease to 
invent, and material progress would 
come to a standstill. But history does 
not bear this out -in the least. Men 
with great mechanical gifts do not 
exercise them solely with a view to 
commercial profit any more than as­
tronomers search the heavens for new 
worlds with an eye to registering pa­
tents on the results of their discover­
ies. 

TO the Board of Ceunty Commissioners for 
Fairfield County. ,, . 

I hereby apnly for a licence to sell Mnritnons 
and intoxicating liquors, al-',laeer beer, rhine 
wine and cider, at Winnipan'c, Town of Is or-

My place of business is not. loca ted within 
200 feet, in » direct line of a church edifice or 
public school-house or thf premises pert.am­
ine thereto, or any post office or public, library. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th of Oct., 18%. 
THOMAS LAYDES, Applicant. 

"We, the undesigned, electors and tax-pay-
ers. as defined by law, of the Town of Norwalk, 
b«rebv endorse the application of the above-
named Thomas Layden for "U^h license , 

r>ated at Norwalk this 15t,h day of Oct., 1896. 
Patrick H. Troy. Joseph Sargent, George 

Ri<l»r, Daniel Lyon« James D. Lane. 
I hereby certify that the above-named en­

dorsers are elector* and tax-pa vers, as defined 
by law. of the Town of Norwa^. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct., 1896. 
HERBERTR. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

TO t.hfl Board of County Commissioners for 
- Fairfield fonnt-T. 

I hereby aooly for a I :een«« t^sell spirituous 
and intoxicating Honors, ale. lagpr beer. Rhine 
win*} and cider at 52 Wall street. Town of Nor-
waUr. 

My p'ace of business is located within 200 
feet of a nost-office. 

Dated at Norwalk t.hi« I5tv> 0f Qnt,, 1896. 
JOHN H ̂ DDEV. Applicant. 

We, the undersigned. "Wt^s and tax 
ers, as defined bylaw, of the Town o' Norwalk, 
hereby «ndorae the application oi the above-
named John Hadd»n for such license. 

Dated at vorwalk thi* 15th day of. Oct.. 1896, 
8. K. Stanley. Francis Fo«ter, William An­

derson. Charles T,. Clover, Georce H. Denton. 
I herebv certify that, the above-nam^d en­

dorsers are electors «nd tax payers, as defined 
by law of the Town of Nnrwn]1'. 

Dated at this !Bfh day of Oct.. T96-
HERBERT B. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

mO the T^ardrof County Commiss'oners for 
X Fair fie'd Tounty. 
I herebv apnly for a licen°e to s»U sniritfrns 

and intoxicating liqnors, ale, lager beer, phine 
wine and cider, at Corner Connecticut Turn­
pike near Ferr's avenue. Town of Norwallr, 

My nlace of business is not, located within 
200 feet in a direct line of a church edifice or 
public schoo1 -house, or the premises pertain 
in<r thereto.or. anypo«t-ofrt,'e or rub'ic library, 

Dated at Norwallr this ist*i da^ of O^t.. 1S96, 
JOHNMc.GOVERN. Applicant 

We. the undersigned, fleeter* and tax-p»fcr-
ers, as defined bv law of the Town of Norwalk 
herebv endorse the application of the above 
named John McG^ve^i" for such ijconsp,' • 

Dated at Norwalk this istli dsv -P Oct. 189« 
John P. Murphv. Fumnhrev Collin', Joseph 

Topp, James Smith. Dennis Covins. 
I hereby certifv thu.t the above-nam»d en 

dorsers are electors and tax-no^ers, as defined 
by law. of the Town oF Norwa'lc. 

Dated at Vorwalk this ivh day of Oct., l«96 
HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

Difficult. 

"So nobody," she faltered, "may 
come between us." His heart heaved. 

"Whoever would do such a thing," 
he fiercely exclaimed, "would be con­
temptibly small." 

And with that he moved even yet 
nearer to her.—Pick-Me-Up. 

TO the T?oird of County Commissioners for 
Fairfield Count.v. 

I herebv apoly fo;r a license t "> sell spirituous 
and intoxicating liquors. al°, lager bee". Rhine 
wine, and cider, at 44 Main street, Town of 
Norwalk. 

M<* place of business is not located within 
200 feet in a direct line of a church edifice or 
public school house, or the premises -pertain 
ine thereto, or an v post-office or public librarv 

Dated at Norwalk this 15fh dav of Oct... 1896 
MICHVKL RA.TCHFORD. Anplicant. 

We, the undersigned, e'ectors and tax-pav­
ers, as defined by 'aw. of the Town op Norwalk 
hereby endorse the application of the above 
named Michael Hatch ford for such license 

1_,ated at Norwalk this 15th dav of Oct.. I89fi. 
Frederick T, Bet.ts. Monson Hovt. William 

E. Dann. Horace G- Burr. Alfred E. Austin. 
I hereby certify that the above-nimed enc 

dorsers are electors and tax-layers, as defined 
by law of the town of Norwalk 

Dated at. vorw»llc this 15th d«ty of Oct. 3896. 
HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

TO the B •'a'-d of County Commissioners for 
Fairfield bounty. 

~I hereby apnly for a license to se'l spiiihiofls 
and intoTicnting Ji'Vors. alel'tgerbeie'-. Rhine 
wine and cider at 20 Main street, Town of 
Norwalk. < 

My place of business is not located within 
20H feet in a, direct line of a church edifice or 
public school- house, or the premises ner'ain 
in<? thereto.or any po-t.-offic.e or puhlic libr 

Dated a;t Norwalk, this 15th dav of Oct. 1896 
JOSEPH MATHEI3. Applicant. 

We, the undersigned, electors and tax-nav-
ers. as defined by law,of the Town o*' Norwalk, 
herebv endorse the ann'ication of the above-
named Joseph M-tt.heis for such license. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day o^ Oct., igifi 
Henry Matheis, James Toner, Williim F. 

DeKlyn. Mortimer W. Denny. Monson Hoyt. 
I hereby certify that the above named en 

dorsers are electors and tax oaver;, as defined 
by law, of the Town of Norwa k. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15rh day of Oct., 1896 
HERBERT R. SMI TH, Town Clerk 

TO the Board of County Commissioners for 
Fairfi >Jd 'Vmnty. 

I herebv apnly for alicense tosel1 spirituous 
and intoxicating Honors, ale. lager beer,Rhine 
wine and cider, at The Norwalk Hotel, 54 Wall 
street. Town of Norwalk, 

My p'ace of business is not located within 
200 feet in a direct line of a church edifice or 
public school-house, or the premises pertain-
J thereto, or anv post office or public library. 

Dated at N irwalk this 15th day of Oct. 1896. 
CHARLES H. TUITlA Applicant. 

We. the undersigned, electors and tax-pay-
ers, as defined by law, of the town of Norwalk 
hereby endorse the application of the above-
nam^d Charles H. Tuttle for such license, 

l'ated at Norwa'k this 15th dav of Oct-, 1896. 
George C. Lockw.iod. William E. Dann. Hor­

ace E. Dann, Francib Leonard, James E. Wood-
hull. 

I hereby certify that the above named en­
dorsers are electors aud tax-payers, as defined 
by law, of th<» town of'Norwalk. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th dav of Oct. 1896. 
HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

TO the Bo*rd of County Commissioners for 
Fairfield County. 

, I hereby apply tor alicense ti sell spirituous 
and intoxicating liquors, ale, lager beer, rhine 
wine and cider, at Wil'tcn Road, Winnipauk, 
lown of Norwalk. 

My place of business is not located within 
200 feet ih d direco line of a church edifice, 
or public schoot-house, or the premises per-
taiuing thereto, or any post-office or public 
library. „ 
.Dated at Norwalk this 15th dav of Oct., 1896. 

" • MAUhlCE McGliATH, Applicant. 
We, the undersigned, electors and taxpay­

ers. as defined by law, of the town of Norwalk 
hereby endorse the application of the above-
ramed Maurice McGrath for such license. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct.. 1896. 
Josepli Sargent, David Louden, William 

Joseph, Jame < Lane. Michael Sullivan. 
I hereby certify that the above-named en­

dorsers are electors and tax-payers, as defined 
by law, of the Town of Norwalk. 

Dated at Vor aralk this 15th day of Oct., 1896. 
HERBERT R. SMIMH, Town Clerk. 

TO the B iard of County Commissioners for 
Fairfield County. 

I hereby apply f >r alicense to sell spirituous 
and intoxicating liquors, ale, lager beer, rhine 
wine aud cider, at 8 Main street, Town of Nor­
walk. 

My plac9 of business is not located within 
200 feet in a direct line of a church edifice or 
nublic school-house, or the premises pertain-
ing theret \ or any post-ortice or public library. 

Datei at Norwalk, this 15th day of Oct., 1896. 
JAMBS M. GREAGtf, Applicant. 

We, the undersigned, electors an4 tax-pay­
ers, as defined by law, of the Town of Norwalk 
hereby endorse the application of the above* 
named James M, Creagh for such license. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15te day of Oct., 1896. 
E. T. Finnegan, F. H. Merrill, W. F. Lojk-

wood. John J. Walsh, Bernard Fe6ney. 
I hereby certify that the above-named en­

dorsers are electors and tax-payers, as defined 
by law, of the Town of Norwalk. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct., 1896. 
HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk, 

TD the Board of County Commissioners for 
Fairfield County. 

I hereby apply for a license to sell spirituous 
and intoxicating liqnors, ale, lager beer, rhine 
wine and cider at 6 River street, town of Nor­
walk. 

My place of bnsiness is not located within 
200 feet in a direct line of a church ejifice or 
public school-house, or the premises pertain­
ing thereto, or any post-office or public library, 

'ated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct. 1896. 
JOHN H. MANNING, Applicant. 

We, the undersigned, electors and tax-pay­
ers, as defined by Taw, of the Town of Norwalk 
hereby endorse the application of the above-
named John H Manning for such license. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct, 1896. 
Bernard Larrigan. William Sheldon, Horace 

E. Dann, William E. Dann. Peter L. Guigue. 
I hereby certify that the above-named en­

dorsers are electors and taxpayers, as defined 
by law, of the Town of Norwalk. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct, 1896. 
HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

for To the Board of Connty Commissioners 
Fairfield County. 

I hereby apply for a Druggists License to 
sell spirituous and intoxicating liquors, ale, 
lager b°er, rhine wine, and cider, at 1 Maia 
street, Town of Norwalk, 

Mv place of business is not located within 
200 feet in a direct line of a church edifice, 
or public school-house, or the premises per-
taining theieio, or any post office or public 
library. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Get., 1896. 
H. GLENDENNING, Applicant. 

We the undersigned electors and tax-payers, 
as defined by law. of the Town of Norwalk, 
hereby endorse the application of the above-
named H. Glendenning for subh license. 

Dated at Norwalk this l*>th day of Oct., 1896, 
Moses H. Glover. G. Willis White, C. L. 

Glover. George W, Holmes, James D. Jennings 
I hereby certify that the above-named en­

dorsers are electors and tax-payers, as defined 
by law, of the town of Norwalk. 
Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct., 1896. 

HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

The corset, though railed against by 
a few dress Reformers, will not go. • It 
has a good grip on its wearers, and, as 
it were, has come to stay.—New Or­
leans ricayune.f > , v 

r|*0 the Board of County Commissioners for 
J Fairfield County. 
I hereby apply for a license to sell spiritu­

ous and intoxicating liquors, ale, lager beer. 
Rhine wine and cider, at 59 Main street, town 
ot Norwalk. My place of business is not loca­
ted within 2C0 feet in a direct line of a church 
edifice or public school house, or the premises 
prti tainirg thereto, or any post office or public 
library. 

Dated at Norwalk th!s 15th day of Oct. 1896. 
- tir o , .JOHN HOGAN, Applicant. 

We, the undersigned, electors and tax-pay­
ers. as defined by law, of tho town of Norwalk 
hereby endorse the application of the above 
named John Hogan for such license. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct. 1896, 
Patrick L. Slat.tery, James Toner, Fred W. 

Smith, Horace E. Dann, Monson Hoyt.. . 
L hereby certify that the above named en­

dorsers are electors and tax-payers, as defined 
ty law, of the town of Norwalk. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct.. 1896. 
HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

TO the Board of County Commissioners for 
Fairfield County. 

I hereby apply for a license to sell spiritu­
ous and intoxic i ting liquors, ale, lager beer, 
Rhine wine and cider at 24 Main street, town 
of Norwalk. My place of business 'n not loca­
ted within 200 feet in a oirect line of a church 
edifice or public school house, or the premises 
pertaining thereto, or any post office or pub 
iic library. 
..Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct.. 1896 
„ MBS. KATE FAHAN, Applicant 
We. the undersigned, electors and tax-pay 

ers, as defiued bv law, of the Town of Norwalk 
hereby endorse the application of the above 
named Mrs. Kate Fahan for such license. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct., 1896 
Edward Cahill. Charles Gehebe, W. Sheehan 

H. E. Dann, David E. Godfre v. 
I hereby certify that the above-named en 

dorsers are electors and taxpayers, as defined 
by 'aw. of the town of Norwalk. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct. 1896. 
HERBERT K. SMITH, Town Clerk, 

Of Hartford, Conn., 

Has Given 

and lower Cost •» 
To Policy Holders than 

ANY OTHER Company 

In the UNITED ST 

RECORD OF POLICY NO. 116,282. 
Issued in 1876, at the tige of '.30, for $1,000. 20-year iSndowment. 

Annual Premium, 

20 Full Premiums, 
Less 20 Dividends, 

. Net cost, 

$46.16, 

$923 20: 
259 32. 1 

$663 83. 

This policy was paid at maturity in 1896, and showing a gain of $336.12 
and 20 years insurance for $1,000, 

The Success which has been attained by the AETNA 
LIFE in producing the combined elements 
of Safety and Lowest Cost to the insured 

is the direct and logical result of a responsible stock management. 

MORGAN C. BULKELEY, President. 
^ JOHX I. HCTCHINSOX, General Accident Agon*,- Hartford 

E. E. HILLOCK, General Azent, 5 Hub!tiger Bid;,, New Haven.' 

TO the Board of Connty Commissioners for 
Fail field Oonnty. 

I hereby apply for a druggists' license to sell 
spirituous and intoxicating liquors, ale, lager 
beer, Rhine wine and cider, at 38 Wall street 
town of Norwalk. 

My place of business is not located within 
200 feet in a direct line of a church edifice or 
public school house.or the premises pertaining 
thereto, or any post office or public lihrary. 

Dated at Norwalk this Wh day of Oct., 1896 
EDWARD P. WEED, Applicant. 

We, th°> undersigned, electors and tax-pay­
ers, as defined by law, of the town of Norwalk, 
hereby endorse the application of the above 
named Edward P. w>ed for such license. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct., 1896. 
C, L Glover, Edward Street, Moses H. Glov­

er. .T. G. Gregory, George C Lockwood. 
I herebv certify that .the above named 

dorsers are electors and tax-payers, as defined 
by law, of the town ot Norwalk. 

Dated.at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct, 1896. 
HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk 

rjiO the Board of County Commiss'oners for 
J Fairfield County. 
I hereby apply for a license to sell spiritu­

ous and intoxicating liquors, ale, lagf-r beer, 
Rhine wine and cider, at. 32 Water street, town 
of Norwalk. My place of business is net loca­
ted within 200 feet in a direct line of a church 
edifice or public school house, or the premises 
pertaining thereto, or any post office or public 
libr«ry. 

Dated at Norwalk thi« 15*h day of Oct. 1P96. 
JOHN MAHONEY, Applicant. 

We, the undersigned, electors and tax-pay­
ers, as defined by law, of the town of Norwalk, 
hereby endorse the application of the above 
numed John Mahoney for such license. 
Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct. 18%. 
James Mit hell, William E Dann. Edwin 

H"vt, Thpmas H. Parkinson, Bernard Feeaey. 
I hereby certify that the above named en­

dorsers are electot s t nd taxpayers, as defined 
by law, of the town of Norwalk. 

Dated at-Norwil'c this isth day of Oct. 1895. 
HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

TO the Roard of CountylCommissioners for 
Fairfifld County. 

I hereby apply for a license to sell spiritu­
ous and intoxicating liquors, ale, lager beer, 
Rliin^ wine and cider at 1 Water street, town 
of Norwalk. Mv place of business is not loca­
ted within 200 feet in a direct line of a church 
edifice or public school house, or the premises 
pertaining thereto, or any post office or public 
library. , 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th divof Oct. 1896. 
JAMES H. UOYT, Applicant. 

We, the undersigned, electors and tax-pay­
ers, as defined by law, of the town of Norwalk 
hereby endorse the application of the above 
named James H. Hoyt for such licens®. 

Dated at Norwalk this I5t.h day of Oct. 1896. 
.Alfred H. Camp, Stephen Comstock, Horace 
E.TJann, Hart Denton, E. Gusowski. 
I hereby certify that the above named en­

dorsers are electors and tax payers, as defined 
by law. of the town of Norwalk. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th day of Oct. 1896, 
HERBERT R. SMITH. Town Clerk, 

PROPELLERS 

City of Noiwalk, Eaele and Vulcan 
. Will Leave Pier 23, E. R., N. Y. (Beekman St.), for 

AT 5 M, 

Leaye South Norwalk Daily at 6 p. M. • _ 

Leave Norwalk Tuesday, Thursday and Saturday at 5 P. M. 

A Lot of 

W O O D E N  

BICYCLE .• HANDLE \ BAR* 
Which I will se^l, for the next week, at, 

$2.50 per pair. 
Also have a look at my line of 

CARRIAGES, WAGONS, BICYCLES, HARNESS AND HORSE 
GOODS. HO TROUBLE TO SHOW GOODS, EVEN 

THOUGH YOU DO NOT PURCHASE. 

TO the Board of County Commissioners for 
Fairfield County. 

I hereby apply for a license to sell spiritu­
ous and intoxicating liquors, ale. lager beer, 
Rhine wine, and cider at 14 Water street, town 
of Norwalk. My place of busines- is not loca­
ted within 200 feet in a directed line of a church 
edifice or public Rchool-house. or t.he premises 
rertaining thereto, or any post-offce or public 
library. 

Dated at Norwalk this IRth day of Oct.. 1896. 
J J. SHEEHAN, applicant. 

We, the undersigned electors- and tax-^y-
ers, as defined by Jaw, of the town of Norwalk, 
hereby endorse the application of the above 
named J. J. Sheehan for such license, 

Dateu at Norwalk. this 15th day of Oct. 1896. 
Jaraes J. Morris. G. F. Austin, (jr. A. Franke, 

Horace E. Dann. James Doueherty. 
I hereby certify that the aboye named en­

dorsers are electors and tax-payers, as defined 
by law, of the town of Norwalk. 

Dated at Norwalk this 15th dav of Oct., 1896, 
• HERBERT R. SMITH, Town Clerk. 

Repairing Done at Short Notice. 

For the next 10 days you can get Bargains in 

WAGONS, CARRIAGES & SLEIGHS 
At LUTHER M. WRIGHT'S, 

Carriage Factory and Repository, Franklin & Madison Sts., So. Norwalk. 

YOU read this advertisement If it had been 
yours aud others had read it, how much 

good it might have done; Send in your copy, 
and we will do the rest. Kates OD application. 7 s 
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6782—CHILDS' COAT. 

JOHN T. HAYES, 
Newsdealer and Stationer. 

The Celebrated 

BAZAR GLOYE-FITTINti PATTERNS. 
Best and newest designs in the world. 15c 

each, Free fashion sheets now ready. 

NO. 5 MAIN STREET. NORWALK. 

Mrs. MEAD'S 
'•——SCHOOL 

WILL REOPEN 

SEPTEMBER 29,1896. 
ALL 
APPLICATIONS 

For admission should be 
made at Hillside at an 
early day. 

W. GILBERT NEWELL'S 
School for 

Dancing and Deportment. 
ARION HALL, SO. NORWALK. 

Class for Misses and Masters, Wednesday, 
October 14, at 4 p. m,; Evening Classes for 
Ladies and Gentlemen. Wednesday, October 
14 at 8 o'clock. The waltz and the latest so­
ciety dances thoroughly taught. Circulars at 
the book and drug stores. Respectfully, 

W. GILBERT NEWELL. 
37 Liberty street, Bridgeport, Ct. 

HERE'S YUR GHAKGE. 
A fine building lot on Wilton ave­

nue. If you intend to build, look at 

this before purchasing. 

Water, gas and sewer on the avenue. 

Will be sold at a Bargain. 

W. H. BYINCTON, 

Real Estate and Insurance 
Room I. Gazette^B*I'd. 

MISS BAIRE'S 
INSTITUTE. 

Norwalk,Conn. 

25THYEAR. 

15th Year in Norwalk. 

BOARDING AND DAY SCHOOL 

Primary, intermediate, academic and college 
preparatory classes. Specialists employed for 
physical culture, elocution, music, art and the 
languages. Careful attention to morals and 
manners. A limited number of day pupils 
and special students admitted. Send for cir­
cular. Early application desirable. 

Miss Baird is at home to visitors on Thurs­
day and Friday of each week until 5 p. m. 

The Fall and Winterjterm of this School 
opens on Thursday the 24th inst. 

FAWCE1TS 
3 WATER STREET. 

Opening of 

Fall and Winter Millinery 
On THURSDAY, FRIDAY and 

SATURDAY, Oct. 1, 2, 3. 
All are cordially invited to attend. 

Everyone making a purchase or leaving _an 
order will be presented with a souvenir. 

FAWCETTS. 
3 Water Street, Norwafk. 

Raymond & Son. 
Successorsto George H. Raymond, 

Furniture Dealers and General Funeral 
Directors. 

18 and 48 Main Street Norwalk ct 
Residence, Beikeley Place 

Tdl«-pkon« No, 7 %.« 

WM. TAYLOR, Bishop of the Me ho-
dist Episcopal. Church in Africa, 
writes : 

"NEW YORK, NOV. 2, 18135.' 
' I know SALVA-CEA to be an ex­

cellent remedy. I have proved its 
healing virtues, both for bruises and 
flesh wounds, and also to kill the 
virus of mosquitoes and chegois." 

E. A. GARLINGTON, Major and Insp'r 
General, U. S. A., writes : 

"WASHINGTON, D. C . , 1  
Apr. 21, 1895. J 

' I have used SALVA-CEA for sore­
ness or rheumatic pains in the muscles 
of my arm, which is disabled from a 
gun-shot wound involving the elbow 
joint; relief was quick and com lete." 

E. G. ISAACKS, Pay Office, Navy 
Yard, writes: 
" BROOKLYN, N. ¥., Aug. 3,1895. 
" Having been a- suf.'crer from 

troublesome Piles, and not only ob­
tained immense relief, but, I can 
safely say, cured, I cheerfully recom­
mend SALVA-CEA to those suffering 
likewise, and hope it will afford them 
the same relief that it has me. 

"P. S. I suffered with Pil.s lor 
more than a year and tried many 
remedies before I was recommended 
to try SALVA-CEA." 

SALVA-CEA does just what it 
is advertised to do. 

Two sizes, 25 and 50 cents per box. 
At druggists, or by mail. 

For deep-seated pain and rheumatism of 
the Joints use Salva-cea, "Extra Strong." 

Sold in tins at 75 cents each. 
BRANDRETH CO., 274 Canal St., N. Y. 

" The Kind Boss Makes his Biscuits with. 

is what you should use in your home 
cooking, if you want the best results 
at the least expense. Yes just 

full of that purest, strongest, and 
most potent of leavening compounds 

Boss . . . 
Baking Powder 

will give you perfect re­
sults when added 

TO I OF THESE. 
filled with flour. We ought to know 
for we have used it for 32 years in the 
manufacture of our famous crackers. 
3,000,000 of LUNCH MILK BISCUIT 
alone, sold last year, lends color to 
our statements—and the thousands 
who have proved by personal experi­
ence all we claim—more than en­
dorse us. Be one of them! 

' MANUFACTURED BY 

C. D. BOSS & SON, ' New London, Conn. 

CITY 
Assessors' Notice. 

We hereby give notice to all persons 
and corporations liable to pay taxes in 
tbe City of Norwalk, that they are re­
quired by law to deliver to tbe Asses­
sors or either of them a written or 
printed list, dated, signed and sworn to. 
of all the property owned by them on 
the first Monday of October, 1896, liable 
to taxation. Otherwise it will be the 
duty of the Assessors to make out Micb 
list according to law, to their l>est 
judgement and knowledge and adding 
10 per cent thereto, which they, bv lnw, 
are compelled to do, and from which 
list so made there is no appeal 

Lists may be returned to tbe Assess jrs 
at the City Council room on the second 
floor of the Fail field County National 
Bank buildins, from and including 
October 12fh to and including October 
Sis*, 1896, (Sundavs excepted) from 10 
o'clock a. m. to 12 o'clock noon and 
from 2 o'clock to 5 p. m , unci on Satur­
day evenings from 7 to 10 o'clock. 

CHAELES OLMSTEAD, ) 
CHARLES N. WOOD, ASSESSORS. 
WILLIAM H.BYINGTON. ) 

City of Norwalk, October lOt-h, 1896. 

TOWN 
Assessors' Notice, 

We, the undersigned, hereby give 
notice to all persons and corporations, 
liable to pay tuxes in the Town of Nor­
walk, that they are rt quired by law to 
deliver to the Assessors or either of 
them, on or before the first day ot 
November, 1896, a written or printed 
list, dated, signed and sworn to, of ail 
property owned by them on the 1st day 
of October, 1896, liable to taxation, 
making a description of all real estate, 
each parcel being separately described, 
otherwise it will be the duty of the As-
seasors to make out such list from tbn 
best information they can obtain, and 
add thereto 10 per cent, of such valua­
tion and in said list, they shall make a 
separate description acd valuation ol 
each parcel of real estate, and from 
which list" so made, there is no appeal 

N. B.—Lists may be returned to tbe 
Asfesforc,at tbe Selectmen's Offic ,bank 
building Norwalk, and at the Council 
Room, H-ivilanti street,South Norwalk, 
trom and mcuidinsr Ouiober loch, 1896, 
to and including Oct >b«r 3lst, 1896, 
said offices to be opt-n from 10 to 12 
o'clock a. m., and from 2 to 5 o'clock 
p. m., and on Saturdays from 7 to*9 
o'clock in the evenim?. 

Dated at Norwalk, October 6, 1896. 
CHARLES SMITH, ) 
J. S-IUBGES RANDALL, >• Assessors. 
JAMES M LANE, ) J. D. Jennings. 

UNDERTAKES 
4 • 
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TITLES? 
A NONSENSICAL HABIT THAT PROM-. 
; ISES TO CONTINUE FOREVER. 

The Affixes and Prefixes of Our Names May 

Properly be Designated as "Flum­

mery," and Give an Excellent Opportu­

nity for National Reform. 

Why do we write "Esq." after a 
man's name or "Mr." before it in ad­
dressing a letter? Why do we write 
"Dear Sir" even in addressing the 
veriest stranger? Why do we sub­
scribe ourselves to all correspondents 
as "Yours truly," or other words to 
that meaningless effect?" 

We do none of these things in tele­
grams, yet we do not feel that we are 
discourteous to John Jones when we 
address him by telegraph only as John 
Jones and sign our names at the end 
of the despatch without any flourish 
of words. Why should we not- be as 
direct, simple and truthful in our 
letters as in .our telegrams? " 

All these pracices are survivals 
from an age of leisure, extravagance 
and servility of mind. They are now 
an absurdity and a costly one. More 
than three billion letters are written 
every year in the United States. Al­
lowing half a minute as the time con­
sumed in writing "Dear Sir" and 
"Yours truly" inside and "Mr." or 
"Esq." outside of each of these letters, 
and allowing 300 working days of ten 
hours each to the year, the people of 
the United States waste in this way 
8,333 years of time every year. In 
other words we actually waste the 
whole time of more than 8,000 persons 
in writing "Dear Sir," "Yours truly," 
"Mr." and "Esq." At the lowest cal­
culation the time thus wasted each 
year is worth ten millions of dollars, 
or half a river and a harbor bill. 

The sole purpose of the superscrip­
tion on a letter is to tell the postoffice 
people to whom ancl where to deliver 
it. All that is necessary for that pur­
pose is to write the name and address. 
"J. Wintersmitli, 34 John street, New 
York City," completely fills the re­
quirement. All else is wasted. There 
is no occasion to tell the postman that 
J. Wintersmitli is a clergyman by writ­
ing "Rev." before his name, or that he 
is a woman and unmarried by writ­
ing "Miss" there, or is married or has 
been, by writing "Mrs." 

But we have worse habits than 
these. In addition tc the meaningless 
"Mr." and the absrrd "Esq." we are 
constantly addressing men as "Hon." 
of "Col." or "Rev." Why do we do 
it? As every little politician who gets 
himself elected an Alderman or a 
member of the Legislature is hence­
forth called "Hon," why should any­
body think it a requirement of cour­
tesy to address so justly distinguished 
ample. :?s "Hon. W. L. Wilson, for ex­
ample. r.s "Hon W. L. Wilson?" We 
do not ^ peak of Hon. Thomas Jefferson 
of He". Daniel Webster. 

Military titles are necessary in mili­
tary life. In addressing a General or. 
a Colonel in the field an indication of 
rank helps to find him, and perhaps 
it helps discipline too. But why should 
we go on calling men Colonel, Gen­
eral, Major and the like long after 
they have retired to civil life, merely 
because they held such rank in the 
volunteer forces of thirty odd years 
ago or because some Governor has ap­
pointed them to his staff? WTe do not 
speak or think of General George 
Washington or General Hannibal or 
General Julius Caesar. 

Still worse is the title gratuitously 
conferred, the "honorary" title of 
Colonel and the like. There are tens 
of thousands of "Colonels" in this 
country who never commanded a 
squad, and "Judges" who never sat 
on any bench or read a page of law. 

It is all falsehood and flummery. 
As an honest self-respecting people, 
why should we not rid ourselves of it?" 
"Mr." is convenient when the first 
name of the person addressed or re­
ferred to is not used. So are "Mrs." 
and "Miss" in like circumstances. All 
the rest are "leather or prunella," 
which is the poet's phrase for stuff 
and nonsense.—New York World. 

" V; forgave Him on file SpSt. •'••if. 

Another story of the late Eugene 
Field's irrepressible love of joking 
comes from the "Youth's Companion." 
He' and his wife had entered a street 
car, to find all the seats taken save 
one at each end of the car, and they 
seated themselves accordingly. 

When the conductor collected the 
fares Mr. Feld announced in audi­
ble tones, as he gave him a dime, at 
the same time pointing to the fay end 
of the car: "That is to pay the fare 
of the lady over there—the one wear­
ing the new. beautiful brown silk 
dress." 

All eyes were turned to her, and her 
pretty face took a most becoming rose 
color, but back_ of the reproving 
glances she threw him was one of 
mingled indulgence, appreciation and 
mirth at the unexpected and appar­
ently truthful announcement. 

Not Considered Good Evidence. 

It is claimed that photographic cop­
ies of an original are not acceptable 
as proof before a court inasmuch as 
the photographs may easily be ex­
changed to. suit the wish. Expert 
picture dealers can take a photograph 
and by various processes secure a 
composite containing several features 
desired that did not exist in the orig­
inal. A photographer of note says 
that it is an easy matter to change 
photographs. Pictures can be made 
to show the body of one person with 
the head of another; or, it is possible 
to insert eertain features desired in 
a photograph. The producers of art 
photographs often use the form of 
one subject and the head of another, 
in order to obtain the most symmetri­
cal results, and thus form a sort of 
composite picture. "By the use of ni­
tric acid," he says, "any part of the 
silver print photograph, the one com­
monly used, can be erased. If the 
picture were a platinum print, which 
is unlikely, the same effect could bv! 
secured by the use of aquaregia, or 
a liquid composed of a mixture of ni­
tric and muriatic acids, which acts 
as a solvent for gold or platinum 
prints." It was shown that original 
signatures could be erased and others 
pasted or copied therefrom, and then 
a photograph taken from which it 
would seem that the result was a per­
fect photograph of an original paper. 

wmmmi 

Fast German Expresa Trains. 

Germany's railways, which are 
owned by the government, are more 
progressive than the average Ameri­
can traveller abroad finds reason to 
suppose. One German express train 
covers 881 miles in twenty-two and a 
half hours, a mean speed, including 
stops, of 39.1 miles an hour, which is 
comparable with some of the best 
American long-distance express runs. 
An express running between Berlin 
and Hamburg covers 176% miles in 
three hours and thirty-six minutes, a 
mean speed of.49.1 miles an hour. 

Mothtr, Have J ou a Baby? 

It so, get from your druggist to day for 
25c a bottle of Dr. Hand's CoTic Cure. 
Every baby often has distressing colic. 
Dr. Hand's Colic Cure gives immediate 
relief by removing wind from the 
stomach and quieting the nerves, giving 
restful sleep Mother, think of the 
worry and anxiety this saves you. If 
your baby is teething Dr. Hand's Teeth­
ing Lotion for 25c soothes and relieves 
all pain. Sold by all druggists. 

Mrs. Samuel Warner of Middletown, 
is a guest of Mr*?. Levi Warner, on 
Arch street. 

1Mother's Find. Nothing Equal to Dr.Hard's 

Colic Cure; 

WATKRBURY Conn., 4-2-'96—Hand 
Medicine Co:—Dear Sirs:—"I am using 
Dr. Hand's Cough and Croup Medicine 
and Colic Cure for my children and find 
nothing to equal them. They work 
like magic. I would not "be without 
them in my house. The little ones love 
Dr. Hand's Colic Cure aud cry for it; it 
relieves them almost instantly. Mrs. 
Frank Smith, 22 Wood St. A.t ,a(U drug­
gists, 25. _ ' 

Mrs. Hollister of New HaveD, is visit­
ing Mrs. George B. St, John on 
Knight street. 

Cure lor Headache. 

As a remedy for all forms of headache 
Electric Bitters has proved to be the very 
best. It effects a permanent cure and 
the most dreaded habitual sick headaches 
yield to its influence. We urge all who are 
afflicted to procure a bottle, and give this 
remedy a fair trial. In cases of habitual 
constipation Electrie Bitters cures by 
givirg the needed tone to the bowels, 
and few cases long resist the use of thi? 
medicine Try it once, large bottle only 
50c and $1.00 at E. P. Weed's drug 
store, Norwalk, and Monroe's New Ca­
naan. 

The late storm has done very Berious 
injury to the Oyster beds along the 
Connecticut shores. 

The Discovery Saved His Life, 

Mr. G. Cailouette, Druggist, Beavers-
ville, 111., says: "To Dr. King's New 
Discovery I owe my life. Was taken with 
La Grippe and tried all the physicians for 
miles aoout, but of no avail and was giv­
en up and told I could not live. Having 
Dr. King's New Discovery in my store, I 
sent for a bottle and began its use and 
from the first dose began to get better, 
and after using three bottles was up and 
about again. It is worth its weight in 
gold. We won't keep store or house 
without it." Get a free trial at E. P. 
Weed's Drug Stor-. Norwalk, and Mon­
roe's, New Canaan. 

The Democratic nominee for probate 
judge of the dhtrict of Danbury is L. 
Legrand Hopkins. 

I o Send in Your Advertisements 

THE 

EVENING 

GAZETTE 
IS THE RIGHT MEDIUM THROUGH WKICH 

TO REICH THE READING PUBLIC. 

Belie/ in Six Hours, 

Distressing Kidney and Bladder dis­
eases relieved in siz hours by the "New 
GREAT SOUTH AMERICAN KIDNEY 
CURE. " This n ew remedy is a great sur­
prise on account of its exceeding prompt, 
ness in relieving pain in the bladder 
kidneys, back and every part of the urin­
ary passages in male or female. It re­
lieves retention of water and pain in pass­
ing it almost immediately. If you want 
quick relief and cure this is your remedy. 
Sold by E. P. Weed, Druggist. Norwalk, 

Conn. 

A bronze tablet has been set in the 
rock of the Regicides' cave at West 
Rock, New Haven. - . 

Dependent Upon Circumstances. 

"Before I give ,r-y consent to my 
daughter's marriage to you, young 
man, I want to know what your pros­
pects foifethe future are." 

"I am trying to settle that question 
now, sir."—Philadelphia North Arner-
Icaa • , .. , JI .... i.-Hi,# 

Bucklln's Arnica Salve. 
Tho Best Salvein the world for Outs 

Bruises, Sores, Ulcers, Salt Rheam 
Fever Sores, Tetter, Chapped Hands 
Chilblains, Corns and all Skin Erup 
ions, and posiitivelycures Piles, or no 
Pay required. It is guaranteed to give 
parf ei}tsatisfaotion,or money refunded 
Prire25oentp per box. T'or Sale by 
E.P. Weed, Norwalk and Monroe, New 
Canaan. 

Mark Stevens is getting out naadBome 
monuments for the Charles P. Turney, 
James L. Ambler and Joseph F. Rus-
coe burial plots. 

During the winter of 1893, F. M. Martin, 
of Long Reach, West Ya., contracted a 
severe cold which left him with a cough. In 
speaking of how he cured it he says: "I 
used several kinds of cough syrup but found 
no relief until I bought a bottle of Cham­
berlain's Cough Remedy, which relieved me 
almost instantly, and in a short time brought 
about a complete cure." When troubled with 
a cough or cold use this remedy and you 
will not find it necessary to try several kinds 
before you get relief. It has been in the 
market for over twenty years and constantly 
grown in favor and popularity. For sale at 
25 and 50 cents per bottle by E. P. Weed, 

The Only Eight-Page One-Cent 

Paper in the Norwalks. 

The Value of an Advertisement 
- c 

DEPEHDS ON THE POCKETS OF THE PEOPLE 

WHO READ IT. IDVERTISEMEHTS IN 

THE EVENING GAZETTE ARE 

READ RY THOSE WHO 

HAVE MONEY TO 

SPEHD. 

ONLY! 
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Stick to 
^ Welcome. 
New England housekeep­

ers are too wide awake to be 
fooled into buying inferior 
soap more than once, just 
because there is a present 

Vgiven with it. 

TRADEMARK 

. On washing-day they \vc.:z i 
only the best soap; next dr.y 
they buy their own present. 

a speedy 
cure for 
the 
most 
obsti-

[HALES 
HONEY 

OF 

nate 
i cough. 

It cannot fail 

HOREHOUND 
AND 

TAR 
•TTTTTTTTM 

Hale's Honey of Horehound and Tar 
acts like magic for a cough or any throat 
or bronchial trouble. Ask your druggist. 

Pike's Toothache Drops cure in one minute. 

WANTED; competent 
Club Agents 
(W omen, 
•Men, Girls 

or Boys) in every town in the 
U. S. to get orders for our cele­
brated goods. LIBERAL TERMS; 
GOOD INCOMES. BIG PKKSK.VTS with 
every sale Good Teas and Cof-
lees, 25c. per pound. Send this 

ftd and 16c. in s amps and we -will mail voti a 1-4 pound 
Beet Imported Tea, any kin I and full particulars. 

-THE GRHAT AMERICAN TEA CO. (S. T.) 
31 4 33 Vesey St., New Vors, P. O. Box 289. -

WINTER V 

IS COMING 
And my new line of Fall 

and Winter Suitings are now 

ready and awaiting your 

inspection. 

Call in and examine tliem 

though you do not purchase. 

Suitings are cheaper, and , 

I mate them up in the 

latest styles at prices that 

will surprise you. 

F. KOCOUR, 
MERCHANT TAILOR 

14 North Main Street, So. Norwalk 

Horace E. Dann, 
EXOELSIOK 

IjitrervjMid Sales Stable. 
Opposite Danbnry and 
Norwalk Railroad depot' 
Norwalk, Conn. Stylish 
Single or Double Team 
with or without drivers' 
Safe horses for women 
andohildrea. . 

SADDL3 H O R S E S  A  S P E C I A L T Y  

80LIC, 
CHAMPS, . 
. DIARRHCEA, 

And all Bowel Tronbles 
Promptly relieved with 

HALE'S 

SAFE CORDIAL 
Large Bottle 25 cents. 

At all Druggist. 

A Few Cutting Remarks! 
4 " 

A Good, Warranted AXE for 

$1.00. 
Best BRADI^EY AXE, 

$1.25. 
Extra Handles, 20 25C. Hatch 

ets, 25c. First-class Buck 
.... Saw, 50C. ' 

H. H. WILLIAMS 

New York State Court of Appeals De­
cides In Their Favor. 

THE DECISION UNANIMOUS. 

The Name* "National Democratic Party*" 

May Be Used on the Ballots—The 

Populists' Visit to Mr. Watson. 

Chairman Butler on Fusion. 

17 Main St; 

ALBANY, Oot. 17.—The court of appeals 
this morning affirmed the decision of the 
appellate, division, second department, in 
tho'case taken up on appeal from the de­
cision of Judge Clements refusing the ap­
plication for a mandamus to compel the 
board of electors of Brooklyn to place the 
candidate of the gold standard Democrats 
on the ofSoial ballot under the designation 
of the "National Democratic party." The 
deoision of the court of appeals sustains 
the right to the use of the designation 
"National Democratic party." 

No opinion accompanies the deoision, 
and costs ate not awarded to either party. 
All the judges concur in the decision ex­
cept Judge Yann, who did not vote be­
cause he is a candidate for office in the 
coming election. s 

The deoision will settle controversies 
that have arisen in many localities in the 
state over the use of the name of the Na­
tional Democratic party by the so oalled 
"ship" Democraoy. 

The Conference With Watson. 
ATLANTA, Oct. 17.—The proposed con­

ference between a subcommittee of the 
Populist national executive committee, 
headed by Senator Butler and Thomas 
Watson, Populist vice presidential nomi­
nee, is awaited with considerable interest. 
It is rumored, notwithstanding the reoent 
positive denials of Senator Butler and 
others, that the visit of the committee will 
result in a formal request for Mr. Watson 
to withdraw, and there are numerous sug­
gestions of offioial positions to be tendered 
Mr. Watson in case he withdraws and if 
the Democrats are successful at the No­
vember election. The stories of the prom­
ised positions range all the way down from 
a cabinet portfolio, but no one claims to 
have definite information as to just-what, 
if anything, will be promised. 

There is grave doubt expressed, however, 
as to whether Mr. Watson will promise to 
withdraw. It is freely stated that the Pop­
ulist manifesto was by no means pleasing 
to the vice presidential candidate, and the 
oommlttee's haste in notifying him of the 
intended visit is said to have been the re­
sult of a fear that he would take precipi­
tate action before the conference could be 
held. That fear was set at rest, however, 
by a message which Mr. Watson sent to 
Chairman Washburn expressing willing­
ness to see the committee. Mr. Watson, 
according to the rumor, allayed the fears 
of the Populist leaders by appending to 
his telegram the statement that he would 
await the coming of the subcommittea 
What the outcome of the committee's visit 
will be is altogether guesswork, but there 
is a growing impression thfifc Mr. Watsali 
will take more kindly to tfte alleged sug­
gestion of withdrawal than he would have 
done at an earlier date in the campaign. 
He is expected to leave Thomson for At­
lanta as soon as he is definitely informed 
as to the time the committee will arrive 
there. There has been some dispute as to 
whether the conference should be held at 
Atlanta or Thomson, but it is thought 
that Atlanta has been decided upon. 

Butler on Fusion. 

WASHINGTON, Oct. 17.—Senator Butler, 
chairman of the Populist national com­
mittee, returned from Chicago this morn­
ing. He expressed himself as satisfied 
with the result of the meeting of the Pop­
ulist executive committee, and also with 
the general outlook. 

"There are only four states," said he, 
"in which fusion has not been arranged— 
Georgia, Florida, North Carolina and 
Tennessee. An adjustment will be reached 
in Florida and Tennessee without doubt. 
So far as Georgia is concerned, the state 
will go either for Bryan and Watson or 
Bryan and Sewall. An adjustment in 
North Carolina is difficult because the 
Democrats rejected several fair proposi­
tions which were made. Regarding- the 
middle western states, Ohio can be classed 
as doubtful; Indiana, with the fusidn ar­
ranged, is safe for Bryan, and Illinois, 
Michigan, Minnesota and Iowa are in the 
balance. I regard it as safe to assume 
that the chances are even in those states— 
that is, that two of the four will go for 
Bryan and silver. Kentucky is safe. West 
Virginia and Maryland are doubtful, with 
the chances, I think, strongly in favor of 
Bryan in the former. 

"In Maryland the result will depend 
upon the Republican farmers. If there is 
enough disaffection among them to offset 
the gold Democratic defection in Balti­
more, Bryan will carry the state. For the 
population, there is a greater gold Demo­
cratic defection in Baltimore, I think, 
than in any city west of New York." 

Dealt In Personalities. 
GREENVILLE, N. C., Oct. 17.—The joint 

discussion between W. H. Lucas and Harry 
Skinner, candidates for congress, nearly 
caused a row and serious trouble. In his 
closing rejoinder Lucas said, "I have been 
t old here today that ex-Senator Jarvis said 
lie heard Skinner lobbying in Washington 
in favor of a bill, and 15 minutes later on 
the floor of the house he made a speech 
Against and voted against the bill." Skin­
ner sprang to his feet and denounced Gov­
ernor Jarvis as an infamous *nd damnable 
liar, using the names of Dr. O. Hagan 
and Alex Blow in the same connection. 
Both these gentlemen were present and 
instantly resented Skinner's insult and 
compelled him to apologize on the spot. 
There was the wildest excitement for a 
few minutes, but no damage was done. 

Visitors to Canton. 

CANTON, O., Oct. 17.—Congressman 
James H. Codding of the Fifteenth dis­
trict of Pennsylvania led a delegation of 
several hundred people from the Lehigh 
valley to the McKinley home today and 
introduced them as miners, mechanics, 
business men and other citizens npresent-
ing that territory. The party was organ­
ized in the towns of Bradford, Luzerne, 
Wyoming and Carbon and adjacent terri­
tory. Their greetings to Major McKin­
ley were most cordial, and their demon­
stration was enthusiastic. 

Tyler and Wetzel counties.of West Vir­
ginia sent greetings to Major McKinley 
with a delegation of representative citi­
zens in a special train of 13 coaches. All 
were addressed by Major MoKinley in a 
Speech which was loudly cheered. 

'' Mr. Bryan's Tour. 
HOLLAND, Mich., Oct. 17.—William J. 

Bryan began work comparatively late to­
day. At Muskegon a goodly crowd had 

gathered, although the meeting had not 
been arranged for until late yesterday. 
The citizens of the place, however, during 
the night had erected a stand near the de­
pot, from which ^Mr. Bryan was to speak. 
They cheered him heartily when, with 
Mrs. Bryan, he einerged^frbm the car, and 
during his discussion of the manner in 
which bimetallism would regulate values 
he was liberally applauded. He said that 
the mint privilege for silver would appre­
ciate the price of silver to that of gold and 
referred to the fact'that in 1873, when sil­
ver was demonetized, tie bullion of a sil­
ver dollar was worth $1.03. 

Ireland's Letter Disapproved. 
LONDON, Oct. 17.—The Daily News 

publishes the following dispatoh from 
Rome: "The Vatican, although in favoi 
of Mr. McKinley, disapproves of Arch­
bishop Ireland's letter because it openly 
mixes religion and politics, which the 
Vatican desires to keep separate in the 
United States. It is fqared that the lettei 
will displease the eastern and southern 
Irish Bryanist Catholics. It is probable 
that instructions ' will be sent to Mgr. 
Martinelli, the papal delegate, concerning 
the attitude of the Catholio clergy." 

Freight Trains Collide. 
NEW ORLEANS, Oct 17.—A head on col­

lision occurred on the Northeastern rail­
road, near Carrier station, between twe 
fast freight trains. William Fulcher, en­
gineer, and his fireman, Alexander, col­
ored, were instantly killed, both engines 
smashed and ten cars splintered and 
burned. The acoident was caused by dis­
obedience of oftders on the part of the dead 
engineer. 

A Change of Date. 
CHICAGO, Oct. 17. — The Democratic 

county committee had planned a demon­
stration of the silver forces of this city fox 
the Sunday before election day. This 
aroused such indignation and drew forth 
so many protests from ministers of all do-
nominations that Chairman Jones was 
forced to give way, so the parade will take 
place on Saturday, Oct. 31, instead. 

Almost a Stampede. 
DETROIT, Oct. 17.—A serious panic was 

narrowly averted in the Detroit Opera 
House. During the second act an indi­
vidual in the gallery began cheering foi 
Bryan. The audience, misunderstanding 
the cause of the shouts, began a stampede, 
but it yas prevented by the presence ol 
mind and promptness of the managers. 

Ex-Speaker Reed's Voice Gone. 
FORT WAYNE, Oct. 17.—Speaker Thomas 

B. Reed of Maine, who spoke here last 
night, is confined to his hotel in this city 
with sickness and was unable to resume 
his speaking tour today. His voice has 
given out, and he is unable to speak above 
a whisper. 

SIB EDWARD OLAEZE NERVOUS. 

He Fears Our Forcing: a Just Decision 
Upon Her. 

LONDON, Oot. 17.—Sir Edward Clarke. 
Q. C., Conservative member of parliament 
for Plymouth and solicitor general in Lord 
Salisbury's previous ministry, in speaking 
publicly at York, expressed great anxiety 
over the outcome of the Venezuelan dis­
pute, in view of the approach of the presi­
dential election. He said the decision of 
the American boundary commission would 
be against England, not because it was a 
hostile commission, but because, he be­
lieved, no honest and impartial arbitrator 
or commission could deoide in favor of 
England's claims upon the evidenoe. 

"We need not have recognized the com­
mission," he said. "We were not called 
upon to negotiate treaties with the United 
States with regard to Venezuela, but it 
the blue book containing the Venezuelan 
brief represented the real and moderate 
contention of Venezuela there ought to be 
immediate negotiations and consent to ar­
bitration. England should be prepared tc 
accept the consequeucs of suoh arbitration 
in the limitation line, which, after all, 
matters very little. 

"If the United States attempted to force 
upon u% the inevitable decision of their 
commission, passionate resentment would 
be aroused here, serious for both countries. 
That is why we are in what I> conceive to 
be a serious risk." 

Wheat In India and Australia. 
SAN FRANCISCO, Oct. 17.—Wheat recov­

ered and in the local market went higher 
than before. All day several leading ex­
porters were heavy buyers, and the desti­
nation of much of the wheat thus bought 
is said to be India and Australia. Instead 
of Chicago prices influencing this market 
the local market now guides other specu­
lators, for California has captured the first 
ot the demand from India and Australia. 

Army Correspondents' Monument. 
FREDERICK, Md., Oct. 17.—Old news­

paper men from all over the country, with 
their friends, were here in great numbers 
to take part in the unveiling of the 
army correspondents' monument on the 
battleground at Antietam this afternoon. 
The ceremonies included the reading of 
papers by James Seney, George Alfred 
Townsend, Junius H. Brown, E. C. Sted-
man and S. Cadwallader. 

Big Blase In Cherry Creek, N. Y. 
BUFFALO, Oct. 17.—The business por­

tion of Cherry Creek was laid waste by a 
fire of probable incendiary origin today. 
The fire broke out in Parsons' store and 
spread until the eutire block on that side 
of Main street was in flames. Everything 
was destroyed, with the exception of Cris-
sey's bank. The loss will reach §25,000. 

Seamen's Wages Reduced. 

SAN FRANCISCO, Oot. 17.—The Ship­
owners' association has reduced wages for 
seamen $5 per month for lumber vessels 
and §2.50 per month for colliers. This rate 
only applies to Pacific coast ships, the 
owners alleging poor business. Much dis­
satisfaction prevails among sailors, and 
a strike is considered probable. 

Gloversville's Clerk Arrested. 
GLOVERSVILLE, N. Y., Oot. 17.—Frank 

H. Wilmarth, city clprk of Gloversville 
since 1890, was arrested today on a charge 
of misappropriating funds and falsifying 
the books of the city. The prisoner pleaded 
not guilty and was held in §10,000 bail for 
examination.on Oct. 22. Wilmarth says ho 
can prove his innocence. 

Cigar Makers'- Convention Over. 

DETROIT, Oct. 17.—The twenty-first an­
nual convention of the Cigar Makers' In­
ternational union closed and the 245 dele­
gates left. The most important action was 
the increasing of dues from 25 cents to 30 
cents per week for each member. Balti­
more was selected as the next convention 
city. 

XlH Czar at Homburg. 
HOMBURG, Oct. 17.—The czar and cza­

rina arrived here today and were present 
at the ceremonies of laying the cornerstone 
of the Russian church here. Ex-Empress 
Frederick was also present. 

These Two Poor Fetich Worshipers Continue to Adore Their False Gail% Bat 
Fortunately the Good Democratic Missionaries Are Rapidly Approaching to 
Teach Them and Their Deluded Followers the True Gospel That There Can Bo No 
Enduring National Prosperity Hxcept on a BMris of an Honest Dollar « . . 

A GRAND OLD DEMOCRAT. 

Who Repudiates ttie Chicago Platform 
and Supports Palmer au.l iiuckner. 

Frederick R. Coudert is a New York 
Democrat who, if he would have ac­
cepted, might have had any place 
within the gift of the people of his 
state any time the past twenty-five 
years. He is probably the most 
famous lawyer in the United States 
and almost equally celebrated as an 
orator and a publicist. In all the di­
visions of the people of New York dur­
ing the life of the present generation 
Mr. Coudert's advice has been spught 
and heeded by thousands of his admir­
ing fellow citizens. When President 
Cleveland prevailed on him to be a 
member of the Venezuela commission 
men of all parties joined in pronounc­
ing it an ideal appointment. 

Mr. Coudert has been to Rome, Italy, 
investigating certain archives for the 
commission; Returning a few days 
ago he gave to the New York news­
papers his views of the present politi­
cal situation in the United States and 
of the feeling of foreigners who own 
property or think of investing in this 
country. He said: 

"The scare which followed Bryan's 
nomination has given way to confi­
dence that American credit will be 
maintained. To my mind the Chicago 
platform is diabolical. The attack on 
the supreme court of the United States 
is absolutely unwarranted. The whole 
platform is a squinting at anarchy. 
I cannot support the nominees who 
stand on it. The greatest danger of 
the Chicago platform is that it rests 
on sectional lines." 

"How about the Indianapolis plat­
form and the nomination of Palmer 
and Buckner?" 

"It is good," replied Mr. Coudert. 
"At the Chicago convention, after the 
nomination of Bryan, a prominent 
southern delegate came to me and said 
that a third ticket was absolutely es­
sential. He said that the old line 
Democrats of the south could not vote 
for McKinley; that they would not 
want to vote for Bryan, but that be­
tween the two they would vote for 
Bryan unless they were given another 
candidate. 

"Now they have a candidate who is 
a Democrat and for whom they can 
vote. I think the third party ticket will 
surely play an important part in the 
defeat of Bryan." 

GOLD BACKS THEM. 

And This Is the Only Reason Why Stand­
ard Silver Dollars Pass at Par. 

It is clear that the reason that the 
silver dollars pass for 100 cents today 
is because the government is behind 
them with gold, by special act of con­
gress, and not because they bear the 
stamp of the government. The stamp 
only certifies that they are issued 
by the United States government, and 
is a guarantee that they contain 412% 
grains of standard silver. Under a free 
coinage act the government would buy 
no silver bullion nor coin any silver 
dollars fd8Vits own account, but only 
coin them for the silver mine owners 
and any one bringing silver bullion 
to the mint, not a dollar of which 
would go into the United States treas­
ury, but would be given to the parties 
bringing the bullion, and would be 
coined at the expense of the govern­
ment. 

Therefore the government would not 
be under any obligation, either legal 
or moral, to redeem dollars coined on 
individual account, and would not as­
sume any obligation to do so. No 
party proposes that it should or would 
do so, and under free coinage it never 
did do so. 

Therefore the silver dollar would have 
nothing behind it but its bullion value 
and would be in the same condition 
as the Mexican dollar. The reason the 
Mexican dollar can be bought today 

sin Wall street at 53 cents is because 
the Mexican government does not stand 
behind it and does not promise to do 
so, and not besause of its inability to 
do so. The question of the relative ability 
of the United States government and 
the Mexican government to keep silver 
dollars at a par with gold is hot at 
issue, as neither of them promises to 
do so under free coinage, and the sil­
ver dollars of both would have noth­
ing behind them but their bullion value. 
—George E. Rogers. 

Gold Does Not Demand Coinage. 
Mr. Bryan said at Portland: "We are 

for gold as well as silver, but hold that 
gold should not demand a monopoly of 
coinage." Gold does not demand coin­
age. It is worth as much in the mar­
ket as at the mint, quite regardless of 
our mint valuation. London, Paris, 
Berlin, St. Petersburg, Calcutta, Shang­
hai and Yokohama would gladly take 
all our gold. They clamor and com­
pete for it. It has a world-value. 
Whatever we coin is more to the ben­
efit of the government and the coun­
try than to the gold producers. The sil­
ver trust is In a very different position. 
It demands the privilege of taking 51 
cents' worth of its bullion to the mint 
and having it stamped as a legal-ten­
der, 100-cent dollar at the people's ex­
pense.—New York World. 

Chicago riatform Not Democratic Doctrine 
The Chicago convention, having: thus de­

parted from the recognized Democratic 
faith and promulgated doctrines new and 
strange to the Democracy, all Democrats 
are. absolved from obligation to support 
Its programme. — National Democratic 
Campaign Text Book. 

Free Coinage Prices. 
. The following table of comparative 
prices in the United Slates and in Mex­
ico were compiled by Mr. Campbell, 
mayor of El Paso: 

United States. Mexico. 
Bacon, per ft ••••• 8 .11 8 .32 
Ham, per ft HHs * .32 
Matches, per gross 60 1.20 
Pickles, 5 gal. kegs 3.25 6.50 
Vinegar, 5 gal. kegs 60 1.40 
Baking soda per dozen... 1.06 8.40 
Salt, 2-ft sacks 43 % .90 
Baking powder 4.C0 9.00 
Molasses, per gal 75 1.60 
Beans, per ft 03 ,17 
Cheese, per ft 12J^ .29 
Candles, per box 6.00 11.75 
Dried peaches & apples... .11 " .35 
Cornstarch, per dozen... 1.06 1.90 
Coffe?, per ft 20 .40 
Soap, per box 3.75 , 5. GO 
Sugarif per sack 5.50 10.75 
Flour, per sach 2.25 8.50 
Rice per ft .05 .HJfi 
Canned tomatoes, case.. 2.25 7.90 

According to the same authority 
Mexican labor is paid from 75 cents ta 
$150 per day in silver, which is 
equivalent to 37% cents to 75 cents in 
American money. 

Free Coinage Defrauds Labor. 
The Chicago platform proposes to de­

grade the coin of the United States by 
means of the free, unlimited and inde­
pendent coinage of silver by our govern­
ment, and by the exercise of the power oj 
the nation to compel the acceptance of de­
preciated coins at their nominal value, 
thereby working an injustice to creditors, 
defrauding the laborer of a large part ol 
his earnings and savings, robbing pen­
sioned soldiers of a part of their pensions, 
contracting the currency by the expulsion 
of gold coin from circulation, injuring, if 
not destroying, domestic trade and foreign 
commerce.—National Democratic Cain-
puigii l>xt ISook. 

WASHING 

POWDER 
CAKE OF TOILET SOAP IN EVERY PACKAGE. 

OUTFITTERS TO MEN. 
OF NEW YORK CITY. 

We wish to thank the people of this town for the 
liberal way .in which they have patronized our sale of Tred­
well. & Slote's clothing stock. Any patron not entirely 
satisfied with goods purchased may exchange same, or we 
will, if desired, refund the money. The sale is still on, at 
one-half (%) off Tredwell & Slote's former, prices. Ready-
made clothing and furnishing goods for men and boys. 
Don't place your order with your tailor or patronize your 
clothier until you have seen the extraordinary value we give 
at this sale. 

We must vacate the premises on January 1st, and all 
goods must be sold. 

SALE AT { 

Tredwell & Slote's Former Stores, 
Broadway, cor. Grand St., New York. 

HOME SECRETS. 

The Mothers Keep Them; But, With 
: a Little Light, There Need 

Be None, y l 

Do you know that forty per cent, of 
tbe children of the whoie world have 
weak kidneys to a greater or less ex-
tent? Mothers know it and there is a 
very mistaken policy o# "saying noth­
ing about it." Sweet, clean, dry beds 
should be and can be the resting place 
by night for our little ones. Home 
mother? attribute it "to habit." It is 
not a habit at all. Why are these chil­
dren who have this habit thirsty at bed­
time? Let us tell yon. Weak Kidneys 
become somewhat inflamed by tbe daily 
activity of the child and demands some­
thing cooling. The result is the same, 
whether they drink or not—wet beds. 
We write our school teachers, asking' 
them to always and quickly permit 
Fred or Nellie to retire on request, as 
their kidneys are weak. Let us set you 
right in this matter. Give such chil­
dren one Doan's K<dney Pill twice a 
day, and as sure as you do, their kid­
neys quickly strengthen to a full ability, 
of retention, and sweet rooms and beds, 
and undisturbed studies at school will 
be the result. Their weakened kidneys 
are nearly always the result of some 
former sicknes?, and as easily cured as 
any childish ailment. Doan's Kidney 
Pills are pleasant for children to take, 
and perfectly harmless. 

An example of the success of Doan's 
Kidney Pills in this trouble, comes 
from Meriden, Conn. Mrs. Wm. Wood 
who lives in that city at No. 130 Colony 
street says: "My little boy of ten 
years of age has always been troubled 
with weakness of the kidneys causing 
him to wet the bed. So many 
mothers punish their children for this, 
but I knew he couldn't help it. I read 
about Doan's Kidney Pills curing in-
continuance of urine in adults and 
thought it might help the little fellow. 
I procured a box and their use produced 
a marked benefit at once. It is very 
seldom be does it now and I shall con­
tinue giving him Doan's Kidney Pills 
until the kidneys are sound and strong. 
It is only out of gratitude that I permit 
publication but the trouble is a very 
prevalent one and most people from 
modesty or diffidence do not speak of 
it. Physicians do not appear to be able 
to cope with the trouble and I consider 
it a mother's duty to tell others about 
it when she has found a specific fdr .this 
terrible annoyance. 

Doan's Kidney Pills are sold for 50 
oents a box, or six boxes for $2.50. By 
all dealeis, or mailed on receipt of price 
by Foster-Milbnrn Co., Buffalo, N. Y. 
sole agents for the U. b. 

No need to scratch your life away. 
Doan's Ointment brings instant relief 
in all cases of Itching Pile?,Pin Worms, -
Eczema, Ringworms, Hives, or other 
itchiness of the skin. Get it from your 
dealer. 

S.B. WILSON, 
PRACTICAL CONTRACTOR 

AND BUILDER. 

Eitinm'ei shjjrfnllv stivji. Lir?3 b'ltl 
a specialty. Contracts taken in 

any part of the country. 

STEAM MILL AND YARD, OFFICE 
8 GROSS ST., 92 WALL SI 

Norwalk, Conn. 
AST*Plans and Specifications fuanished. 

CRUM MAN 
BROTHER I 

• MANUFACTTJEEBS OF • 

IMPROVED SODA MD MIN­
ERAL WATERS. 

Flavoring Extract,s Also the 
Syrups and Olden Time 
Fruit Juices, Root Beer. ' 
I^mon Soda, Soda Water 
Sarsaparilla, Supplied in 
Birch Beer, Steel Fountains. 

Seltzer and Vichy in Siphons. 

Address • 

H. J. & G. S. GRUMMAN, 
41 Main Street, Xorwalk; Conn 

DRINK 
HATHORN 
SPRINC 
WATER 

FOR THE 

Stomach, 
Bowels, 

Liver and 
Kidneys# 

' FOR SALE BY » > 

Tie Holmes, Mer & SsM CG 

.m ail 

vl; 

;ys 
- -4# 

".^1 

rJs fjiy? 
S'ill ' 



" -T - > < '• - • " V M- " V 

' - v -

T H E 

m  

AU ASCHBI3H0FS 

*" n "" v ' . ; 

E V E N I N G  Q  A  Z  R  T T E  
'-v.-

•: A . .; • , .; • --V.;-A . V ^' 

??-K V 

c# 
:j? 

Alleged Dynamiters Kearney 

Haines Tell Their Story. 

ENTICED INTO KOTTERDAM. 

They Were Arrested, Locked Up and 

^ Urged to Confess Something < 

They Knew Nothing—Plot of 

NEW YORK, Oct. 17.—John F. Kearney 
and Thomas Haines, the two alleged Irish 
dynamiters who were arrested in Rotter­
dam on Sept. 13, arrived today on the 
steamship Werkendam. 

Besides a few personal friends, there 
was no one on the pier to receive them. 
Kearney's wife did not receive telegraphic 
notioe of the arrival of the vessel until 8 
o'clock, and she was not present Kear­
ney, however, waited for her at the ferry-
house, and at 10 o'clock he greeted his 
wife and 9-year-old daughter. The meet­
ing was an affecting one. 

Ten minutes later Kearney, his wife 
and ohild and Thomas Haines were on' 
their way to Kearney's home, at .979 
Washington avenue, Hoboken. Haines ac­
cepted an invitation to stay with Kearney 
a few days. 

Both men tell remarkable stories, and 
both vigorously deny that they had ever 
been engaged in any dynamite plot They 
insist that their arrest was due to a plot 
on the part of the English detectives. 
Kearney also believes that his own broth­
er-in-law? was one of the prime movers in 
it; that .Total Gort, the name the brother-
in-law goes by, is in the pay of the Eng­
lish government, and actually laid the 
wires which brought Kearney to Rotter­
dam, knowing that the English govern­
ment wanted him for an alleged dynamite 
offense, said to have been committed in 
Glasgow many years ago. 

Kearney as well as Haines seemed 
amazed when informed of the stories pub­
lished concerning bim, particularly that 
which said that £2,000 of English money 
had been found in his possession in Rot­
terdam when arrested. 

"The fact of the matter is," he said, 
"that I left New York with less than 
$150, and that at the time of my arrest I 
had only $95.40. Some of that was in 
Belgian money. I have brought back 
with me exactly $1.25. 

Did Not Slake Bombs. 

"As to the story that I was engaged in 
the manufacture of bombs or other de­
structive affairs, I want to say right here 
that there is not a word of truth in the 
story. 

"I started for Europe on Aug. 1, my 
brother-in-law purchasing the passage 
tickets with money which I gave him, and 
it was not until I was many days out that 
I found my name had been changed from 
Kearney to Wittges. My wife, as every­
body who knows me is well aware, is a 
German, and there is a little property 
coming to her over there. 

"This brother-in-law suggested that it 
would be a good thing for both to take a 
trip over and have the estate settled. As 
I did not intend starting my paper, The 
Irish Nationalist, until September, I read­
ily consented to go. 

"I had a pretty good time in both Ant­
werp and Rotterdam, living in the most 
economical manner, though, until two 
days before my arrest. 

"While in a saloon ^>ne day I, for the 
first time, saw Mr. Haines. I recognized 
him as an American, as he did me. I 
have a smattering of the German lan­
guage, while he has a very poor idea of it. 
We had a drink, and then I learned from 
him that he was in Europe on a vaoation. 
He asked me if I could tell him a good 
hotel to stop at, and I invited him to mine. 

"When we got to the hotel, we found 
that there was not a vacant room, so I of­
fered him, as I would to any other Ameri­
can, a share of my bed. 

"Well, Haines and myself looked about 
for the first day, and then he became very 
ill, and I had to nurse him. He was lying 
ill in bed on the morning of Sept. 13. It 
was about 6 o'clock, if I remember rightly, 
when there was a knock at' the door. I 
opened it and found six policemen and an 
Englishman, whose name I do not know, 
standing outside. Each carried a small 
arsenal, and then I was tolcl that we were 
both under arrest. 

"The room was never searched in our 
presence. Indeed we were bundled out­
side and taken to the station house. In 
our absence they claimed to have searched 
the room and found a number of infernal 
machines under the bed upon which I was 
lying. 

Scented a Conspiracy. 

"They showed me some of the machines, 
and at very thought of what I had been 
lying on I nearly dropped dead. 

"Now, what sane man would deliber­
ately go to sleep on such machines? I think 
I have a little sense left. I said that if the 
machines had been found there at all they 
must have been placed there by some­
body else; that I was not such a fool. 
They woulfln't believe me, or at least they 
claimed not to believe me, and said I could 
tell all about it if I would. Then I was 
taken to a cell. 

"Every day for 12 solid hours two po­
licemen 6at in the cell with me, and I was 
not allowed to lie down. They kept telling 
me all the time that I had better save my­
self, as one of my 'pals' had confessed. 
They spoke to me of £ynan and Bell. I 
met Tynan once or twice in New York, 
but never knew bim. I did not know Bell 
at all. Yet they kept harping about con­
fessions and informers until I got siok of 
listening and refused to talk at all except 
to demand my release. * 

"I was never brought into a police court, 
but always before the police commission­
ers, who kept harping on the same theme. 
They told me that my only hope was to 
save myself by confessing. Then they put 
me on hard tack. I have brought some of 
it back with IA, and it was all that I 
could get." 

Wine Qi 

• SANTA ROSA, Cal., Oct. 17.—Korbett's 
big winery at Korbett's Station was badly 
damaged by fire. One of the large presses 
of was destroyed and about 150,000 gallons 
new wine were turned loose. Water being 
scarce, pumps were applied to the wine 
casks, the wine being thrown on the fames 
with good effect. The cellars, in which 
were 100,000 gallons of old wine, were 
saved. 

Bie Gold Imports. 
NEW YOEK, Oct. 17.—The steamship 

Columbia, from Southampton, brought 
11,652,500 in gold, and, in addition to the 
gold engagements already noted, Ladan-
burg, Thalman&C'o. have $250,000 on the 
way. 

I .Earthquake In Mentone. 

• NICE, Oct 17.—An earthquake shock 
Was felt at Mentone at 6:SO tb's morning. 

, , • " : 

FUNEBAL. 

A Great Crowd Attended the Services In 
the Cathedral at Canterbury. 

'•'•LONDON, Oct. 17.—The funeral services 
over the body of the Most Rev. Edward 
White Benson, archbishop of ^Canterbury 
and primate of all England, who was 
stricken with apoplexy at the services in 
the Hawarden church last Sunday morn­
ing, wero held in the cathedral at Canter­
bury today. The edifice was crowded. 
Among those jn attendance were the Duke 
of York and l&inoe Charles of Denmark 
as the representatives of the queen, and 
the Prince of Wales, the Duke of Con-
naught, the Duke of Cambridge and a 
host of ecclesiastical, political and sooial 
dignitaries. There were several distinct 
services, the first one beginning at 8 
o'clock in the morning. The coffin con-

body of the arch bishop 
with a whiteand gold embroidered 

plaoed in front of 

taining the 

pall and was plaoeft in front of the altar, 
surrounded by lighted tapers. The Very 
Rev. F. William Farrar, D. D., dean of 
Canterbury, opened the series of services 
by celebrating the function of holy com­
munion. 

The weather was extremely disagreea­
ble, a heavy rainfall, accompanied by 
high winds, prevailing. Everybody pres­
ent wore deep mourning, and the primate's 
throne was heavily draped in black. 

The funeral procession was formed in 
the cloisters of the oathedral at 12 o'clock, 
the clergy attached to the diocese leading, 
followed by members of the house of com­
mons, members of the l^ouse of lords, 
bishops and members of the convocation. 
Then came the Most Rev. William D. 
MacLagan, D. D., archbishop of York and 
primate of England; the Most Rev. Wil­
liam C. Lord Plunket, D. D., archbishop 
of Dublin; the Very Rev. F. William Far­
rar, dean of Canterbury, and the Rev. 
Hugh Benson. Next came the coffin, with 
the pallbearers, the Earl of Cranbrook, 
Lord Ashcombe, Lord MacNaughten, the 
dean of Lincoln, Sir E. M. Thompson and 
the chancellor of Truro. 

Within the cathedral the family and 
relatives of the dead archbishop, the fam­
ily of the archbishop of York and private 
mourners occupied places in the rear of 
the choir. As the prooession reached the 
nave the choir sang Gounod's "Send Out 
Thy Light" and afterward a special an­
them composed by Sir Herbert Stanley 
Oakeley, composer to her majesty in Scot­
land and professor of music in the Uni­
versity of Edinburgh. The clergy who 
officiated at the interment were Canon A. 
,T. Mason of Canterbury, the Right Rev. 
Randall T. Davidson, bishop of Winches­
ter, the Rev. Hugh Benson and the arch­
bishops of Dublin and York. 

A PECULIAR ACCIDENT. 

A Jersey City. Merchant Walfas From a 
Train While Asleep. 

TRENTON, Oct. 17.—Lewis Dressier, a 
Jersey City merchant, died in St. Francis' 
hospital from injuries received late on 
Wednesday night by falling from a train 
whioh was running at a rate of 40 miles 
an hour. He walked from the train while 
asleep. He was on his way to Pittsburg. 
When a few miles above Trenton, a brake-
man went through the car and called out, 
"Trenton the next stop!" Mr. Dressier 
rushed to the platform and jumped from 
the train. He fell on the tracks, breaking 
the bones of both legs and several ribs. 
The trainmen did not know that he left 
the train until they reached*Trenton. The 
station agent at once sent men on a loco­
motive to find Mr. Dressier, but they were 
unsuccessful. The man had in the in­
terval crawled up the embankment to the 
street level and along the street for several 
squares until a brewery was reached, 
where be applied for assistance. He stated 
that he had jumped off the train while 
dreaming. He then collapsed and was 
taken to St. Francis' hospital, where he 
continued to sink until he died. 

RICH LANDS IN THE NORTH. 

Discoveries of an Officer of the Dominion 
• Geological Survey. 

MONTREAL, Oct. 17.—Mr. Tyrell of the 
geological survey department has arrived 
at Winnipeg, bound for Ottawa, and re­
ports having discovered rich tracts of ag­
ricultural and stock raising country hith­
erto unknown. He left Selkirk on Jan. 
24. From Norway House he descended 
the Nelson river in a canoe to the Pine 
river, ascending it to Wolf river. Again 
the Nelson was descended for 75 miles un­
til the Brentwood river was reaohed, 
thence down the Grassy river to the Stur­
geon, which brought them to the Sas­
katchewan at Cumberland House. Ten 
days ago they reached Prince Albert. Mr. 
Tyrell says that there are large areas of 
rich, cultivable lands west of the Nelson 
river, and, though wheat is not grown 
simply because it would be of no value, 
all varieties of vegetables are produced in 
the gardens of the Hudson Bay company 
posts and prove hardy. Except for the 
climate, he declares that that country is 
as richly blessed as the famed Red river 
valley. 

Bank Ban In Wlllimantic. 

WILLIAMANTIC, Conn., Oct. 17.—Owing 
to a run on the Williamantic Savings in­
stitute, during which $70,000 has teen 
withdrawn, the directors of the bank to­
day issued a statement in which they an­
nounced their intention of taking refuge 
behind the "four months' notice" law. 
The cause of the run is not known. 

Panic While at a Fire. , 

TROY, N. Y., Oot. 17.—During a fire in 
Tim & Co. 's factory here this afternoon a 
panic occurred, and the employees made a 
wild dash for fire escapes. Several fell 
from the escapes, but none was fatally 
hurt. Kate Keith, Mamie Farrell and 
Margaret Noonan fainted and fell, but 
were caught by firemen. 

Mysterious Schooner Sail!*. 

NEW YORK, Oot 17. — The schooner 
Joseph F. Loubat sailed today. The 
Loubat is said to be on a gold hunting ex­
pedition to South America, and it has also 
been rumored that Cuba is really her des­
tination, in the interests of the insurgents, 
instead of Buenos Ayres, the port for 
which she was cleared. 

Defaulting Treasurer Arraigned. 

TROY, N. Y., Oct. 17.—George H. Mor­
rison, the defaulting treasurer of Rensse­
laer county, was arraigned in the circuit 
court U-day. He entered a plea of not 
guilty. «nd his trial was set down for 
Nov. 9. Justice Parker agreed to preside 
at the trial. 

• One Day's Government Receipt*. 

WASHINGTON, Oct. 17.—.National bank 
notes received today for radepmtion, $282,-
485; government receipts from internal 
revenue, $447,254; customs, $338,449; mis­
cellaneous, $2,156. 

Troops For the Philippines. 

BARCELONA, thousand 
infantry embarked here 
the Spanish troops in 

to re-enforce 

GOLD IS IT A PREMIUM 
. ' ' 

Foreign Bankers Have Hade Profit; 

Out of Apprehensions, 

A CONSERVATIVE TIMIDITY. 

Dan's Review Considers That the Most 

Powerful Force I 

Failures of the Week. 

NEW YORK, Oct 17.—R. G. Dun % 
Co. 's weekly review of trade says: 

Gold commands a small premium. The 
most powerful force in business at 
is a conservative timidity, and the 
bankers, who have been offering for a 
small percentage to insure people against 
a premium on gold until December have 
made an easy and a sure profit out of 
prevalent apprehensions. From Kansas, 
Nebraska and other states where the silver 
agitation is said to be strong oome orders 
by many bankers and business men to get 
them gold at a small premium, and there 
has also been some demand for hoarding 
from individuals in other states who are 
afraid even of their own best judgment. 
The tone of money markets and the gen­
eral condition of business are to a great 
extent determined by men who take coun­
sel only of their fears. 

The one commercial change which, 
more than any other, insures better busi­
ness in the near future is the excess of 
merchandise exports over imports. In Sep­
tember exports were §85,098,594 and im­
ports only $50,825,705, and the excess of 
exports was §34,272,889, in payment for 
which net imports of gold were 134,249,-
183. Last year the excess of merchandise 
imports was $6,765,257 in Saptember, and 
net exports of gold $16,506,558. In the four 
principal classes exports increased $20,-
641,134, more than half in cotton. In two 
weeks of October the exports from New 
York have increased 30.6 per cent, against 
31.2 in September, while imports have 
decreased 2 A per cent, against 35.2 in Fep-
tember. Continued shipments of gold from 
Europe', not including ?4,000,000 from 
Australia, now amount to £59,250,000 
since . the movement began, of which $52, 
250,000 has already arrived, a(nd havn not 
been arrested by measures taken by she 
great European banks. 

The aiovement of Grain. 

The heavy movement of grain is the 
cornerstone. After an increase of ?5,928,-
675 in exports of breadstuffs in September 
there have been shipped the past week 
from Atlantic ports alone 2,134,774 bush­
els, flour included, and 4,£03.845 in two 
weeks of October against 3,510,271 bushels 
last year. A more important fact is that 
all available grain fre! hts have been en­
gaged for months abmil here and on the 
Pacific coast. The minister of agriculture 
in India stated in council on Thursday 
that distress was expected in a large part 
of India as the result of drought, but im­
portations of wheat from California would 
help to prevent actual famine. A high 
official of Russia now in this country con­
firms accounts of shortness in the Russian 
yield. Thus estimates that Europe will 
fall 100,000,000 bushels short of last year 
in sui v of wheat are strongly supported, 
and, while department estimates of yield 
in this ountry are not credited, there is 
every teason to expect a remarkable for­
eign de uand. Western receipts fall a lit­
tle below last year's, and for two weeks 
have been 14,235,016 bushels against 15.-
084,483 last year. Wbedt has advanced 
4K cents for the week, arid corn 2 cents. 

Confidence as to the future makes trou­
ble in some industries, because speculation 
in materials raises prices so that demand 
for finished products is checked. Similar 
difficulties threaten in the iron manufac­
ture, for pig is higher—bessemer at ?il.50, 
and gray forge at §9.75 at Pittsburg, 
while plates, angles and beams are weaker, 
and various comb.nations hold prices only 
by leaving outside competitors to take the 
market as far as they can. Steel bars are 
largely sold at 1 cent, while 1.2 is de­
manded for iron. All the nails that out­
siders can produce are sold at less than 
the association asks. Billets are still sold 
for less than the pool price, and their ship­
ments in September aggregated only 36,-
000 tons, mainly of sheet and tin plate 
bars, and the demand for fails is growing 
small. 

Wool Storage. 

Wool is stronger with continued specu­
lative buyir.T, and sales at eastern mar­
kets have been 14,536,300 pounds for two 
weeks against 21,209,700 last year and 
13,702,800 in 1892, but consigned wool 
has been mostly withdrawn until after 
the election. No gain is at present possible 
in goods, and though the number of mill3 
starting for the week is 15, against 7 
stopping, much of the work done is in an­
ticipation of a better demand than now 
exists. The wotfcon manufacture has also 
started more spindles, but the demand for 
goods soarcely increases, and print cloths 
sell at 2.56 cents. The manufacture of mi­
nor metals also drags, though domestic 
demand for copper is moderate at 10.75 
cents for lake. Lead is a shade weaker at 
2.75, and tin plate makers are undersell­
ing foreign 15 to 20 cents per box. 

Little is dene in commercial loans, al­
though collections are reported better and 
some dry goods loans have been settled be­
fore maturity. Tie demand for loans is 
narrow, and bankers are inclined to dis­
courage expansion for the time. Failures 
for eight days of October show liabilities 
of $4,944,004, against $3,925,599 in ten 
days last year and $3,821,937 in 11 days of 
1894. Manufacturing were $2,672,742, 
against $1,536,205 last year and $1,793,636 
in 1894, and trading were $2,151,262, 
against $2,185,534 last year and $1,996,636 
in 1894. Failures for the week have been 
328 In the United States, against 263 last 
year and 40 in Canada, against 46 last 
year. _ 
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To cleanse, pnrify, and 

scalp, and hair, to allay itching i 
heal chafings, excoriations, and 
nesseB, to speedily cure the first symptoms of 
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Than we did in any week of last year. In order .. 

that this week shall go ahead, and it musf, 

0 is#*. 

Jackets and Capes. 
15 Black Broadcloth Cape®, $1-98 
10 Black Boucl**, fur trimmed 

Capes, 3.25 
10 Salt's Plush Capes, 3 75 
18 Black Bouc^e Jackets, ' 5 00 
9 heavy light Covert Jackets, 6 75 
7 Irish Freii e Jackets, 8 25 
17 fine Boucle. silk lined Jackets, 11.98 
6 fine Keisev, tan, green and 

black Jackets, 14 98 

Furs. 
Furs are cheaper this year than last, 

for the reason, as we told our patrons, 
last year was not, a fur year. Hence, the 
accumulation of slo'iis make the prices 
lower. We can tell you a pretty 

11 in. Coney Collarette for 
13 in.ilectric Collarette for 
A large sweep Electric Seal Cape 

fo r 
1 145 sweep Coney Cape, 

27 in. Electric fehoulder Cape, 
3^ in. Astrackhan Gapes, 

6. 

18.50 
7 50 

12.00 
25.00 

Our Silk Bargains. 
Did 3'Ou secure one of them from the 

great anction sale of Silks? We have a 
few numbers left. We sold more silk 
last week than was sold in Norwalk in 
three months. * 

Black gro grain, large figure; this Silk 
we never sold less than $l;our sale 
price is 50c 

Cheney Bros.' best plain and figumi 
Taffetas; sold by everybody that 
carried them at $l-.50; sale price 7oc 

Dress Goods. 
It is surprising to hear so many ladies 

say, "I never bought a nice dress in 
Norwalk before." They won't have oc­
casion to say so again, for the ladies that 
have looked at our Di ess Goods tell us 
that the range of styles and prices are as 
good as they ever saw in New York. 

50 in. heavy fine black Serge, a 
yard, 50c 

40 in. Silk and Wool Plaids, , 50c 
38 in. Fancies, twelve styles, 39c 

52 in. two tone Mixtures, S7^c 
36 in. all wool Ser^e, all colors 

and black, 25c 
38 in. Ombre Plaid Suiting. 59c 
40 in. black, large fiigure, Fancy, 25c 

Underwear. 
Dor't tVrow your money away on 

chea- Und< rwe.nr Good Underwear is 
the aw m ; "prii cheapest 

Men's gra white Merito, ribbd,a 
fleeced lined L 11 '< r all houses 
asked 75c; on: .• e 50c 

I^adies n'- i i-zerne unshrink­
able Uuder\\. ar, nu • quality wool, 
sold all through New \urk for 1.25 
our price, 1.00 

Ladies' and Misses' combination Suits, 
fleeced lined, all sizes, per suit, 50c 

Misses' Egyptian Vests and Pants, 
sizes 3 to 7, regular price, 3l)c; this 
sale, 25c 

Boys' and girls' heavy fleeced ribbed 
Vests, Pants and Prawer?, all sizes, 25c 

Misses' Australian wool Underwear, 
sizes 16 to 22, 50c; sizes 24 to 28. 75c; 
sizes 30 to 34, $1.00 These are 25 per 
cent less on the size than N. Y. prices. 

THE BOSTON SM Car. Main anil Wall Sb 

SHOE STORE 
Is shaming the 

Finest and Largest Line of Shoes, • 
Ever placed on sale, for the Fall of 1896, in Norwalk. 

. In H£.nan & Son's well-known line, we wish to invite 

your inspection of the following styles of Toes in Shoes. 

Bull Dog Patent Leathers, 

Bull Dog Enamel Leathers, 

Royal Toe in both Calf and 

Patent Leather, 

New Enamo Calf with 

Double and Single Soles, 

These Goods are strictly 

Our Winter Tan, 

"Bull Doe Toe with 

Double Sole and Rope 

Stitch aroundtthe Edge," 

Is simply 

Perfection itself. 

UP-TO-DATE, :V 

and are onlv a few 01 the many new styles we have added to our 

immense stock of both Ladies' and Gents'^ Fine. Shoes, 

A full line of TRUNKS, BAGS, MACINTOSHES land'RUBBER 
CLOTHING. YourShoes shined free at the 

LEADING SHOE STORE.! 

0LSEN BROS 
••••*• 1' 
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Gazette Building 
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